
 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA

CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS   .   11465 WEST CIVIC CENTER DRIVE   .   AVONDALE, AZ 85323

 
WORK SESSION 
December 6, 2010 

6:00 PM 

  CALL TO ORDER BY MAYOR ROGERS  

   

1 ROLL CALL BY THE CITY CLERK

2 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO AVONDALE MUNICIPAL CODE - CHAPTER 4 - BUILDING 
REGULATIONS

 

City Council will discuss amendments to Chapter 4 of the City Code, Buildings and Building Regulations, the 
2009 Editions of the International Building Code, the International Residential Code, the International 
Mechanical Code, the International Plumbing Code, the International Fuel Gas Code, the International 
Energy Conservation Code, the 2008 Edition of the National Electrical Code, and the Avondale Amendments 
to these codes. For information, discussion and direction only. 

3 ADJOURNMENT  

 Respectfully submitted,   

 

 
Carmen Martinez 
City Clerk

 

 

Individuals with special accessibility needs, including sight or hearing impaired, large print, 
or interpreter, should contact the City Clerk at 623-333-1200 or TDD 623-333-0010 at least 
two business days prior to the Council Meeting. 
 
Personas con necesidades especiales de accesibilidad, incluyendo personas con 
impedimentos de vista u oído, o con necesidad de impresión grande o interprete, deben 
comunicarse con la Secretaria de la Ciudad at 623-333-1200 o TDD 623-333-0010 cuando 
menos dos días hábiles antes de la junta del Concejo.

 

 



CITY COUNCIL REPORT

SUBJECT: 
Proposed Amendments to Avondale Municipal 

Code - Chapter 4 - Building Regulations 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

  

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Sue McDermott, P.E., Director of Development Services & Engineering, 623-333-4211

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager

PURPOSE:

The purpose of this item is to discuss with the City Council amendments to Chapter 4 of the City 
Code, Buildings and Building Regulations, the 2009 Editions of the International Building Code, the 
International Residential Code, the International Mechanical Code, the International Plumbing Code, 
the International Fuel Gas Code, the International Energy Conservation Code, the 2008 Edition of 
the National Electrical Code, and the Avondale Amendments to these codes. This item is for 
discussion purposes only. 

BACKGROUND:

The Codes were developed by the International Code Council and the combined efforts of various 
affected parties including the Arizona Building Officials, the National Association of Homebuilders, 
the Federal Emergency Management Agency (FEMA) and the American Institute of Architects. The 
most recent version available for adoption is the 2009 series. The National Electrical Code was 
developed by the National Fire Protection Association (NFPA). The 2008 International Electrical 
Code cross references the 2008 National Electrical Code. The various jurisdictions in Arizona 
historically adopted the National Electrical Code to avoid unnecessary duplication.  
 
For the purpose of statewide uniformity, the Arizona Building Officials, Inc. formed a subcommittee to 
formulate a set of uniform code amendments and held regular meetings throughout 2009 in various 
locations around the State. The subcommittee encouraged and received input from code officials, 
design professionals, local homebuilders and other affected parties. The subcommittee's 
recommendations were presented to the MAG Building Codes Committee for reference as uniform 
code amendments. The MAG Building Codes Committee recommended these uniform amendments 
as a MAG standard in May 2010. 

DISCUSSION:

The City periodically updates its building codes to stay current with industry standards and be 
consistent with the building regulations of other local communities. The City Code currently 
incorporates the 2006 series of the International Building Code, the International Residential Code, 
and the International Mechanical Code; the International Plumbing Code; the International Energy 
Conservation Code, the 2005 National Electrical Code and the related MAG Amendments. These 
codes were adopted by the City of Avondale in February 2007.  
 
The proposed ordinance will amend Chapter 4, Article II Section 4-16 and 4-17, Article III Sections 4-
31 and 4-33, Article V Sections 4-61 and 4-62, Article VI Sections 4-76 and 4-77, and Article XI 
Section 4-151 of the City Code. Due to revisions in the valuation chart that is used in calculating 
building permit fees, the effective date of the ordinance is proposed to be February 7, 2011 to allow  
 

 



for the 60-day notice required for fee adjustments. This will also provide the construction industry 
time to adjust their building plans as needed prior to the effective date.  
 
Some of the other Cities in the state are in the process of adopting the 2009 Codes. All of the 
members of MAG have agreed to adopt the 2009 Codes along with the recommended amendments 
in 2011. The Arizona Home Builders Association, and Architects and Engineers Groups in Arizona 
have all been involved in the development of the MAG amendments and are in support of them.  
 
Staff will provide the City Council with a summary of significant code revisions. 

BUDGETARY IMPACT:

When adopted, the new codes will include changes to the fees charged for building permits. 

RECOMMENDATION:

This item is for Council discussion and direction. Staff proposes to request City Council approval of 
the new building codes at the February 7, 2011 City Council meeting. 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

Proposed Avondale Amendments



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

THE AVONDALE AMENDMENTS TO 

THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 

THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, 

THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE 

THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE 

 THE 2008 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE 

THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE 

THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE 

 

 
 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

1 

AVONDALE AMENDMENTS 

TO THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE  

 

The International Building Code, 2009 Editions, is amended in the following respects: 

 

Section 101.1 is amended as follows: 

 

Section 101.1 Title.  Insert the words “City of Avondale” as the name of jurisdiction. 

 

Section 101.2.1 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 101.2.1 Appendices.  The following appendices are adopted by the City of 

Avondale: Appendices B, C, I and J.  

 

Section 101.4 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following:  

 

Section 101.4 Referenced codes.  The other codes listed in Sections 101.4.1 through 

101.4.6 and referenced elsewhere in this code shall be considered part of the requirements of this 

code to the prescribed extent of each reference. If another code is referenced elsewhere in this 

code and has not been adopted, then that section shall be considered invalid. 

 

Section 101.4.3  is amended as follows: 

 

Section 101.4.3 Plumbing.  Delete the last sentence “The provisions of the International 

Private Sewage Disposal Code shall apply to private sewage disposal systems”. 

 

 

Section 109.3 is amended as follows: 

 

Section 109.3 Building Permit Valuation.  The following shall be added after the last 

sentence: 

 

For the purposes of determining valuations, the following chart, titled “Valuation Chart”, 

shall be used. This “Valuation Chart” shall be updated on January 1st of each year with the Cost 

per Square Foot. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

2 

VALUATION CHART 

 

Group 2003 International Building Code Types of Construction, Cost per Square Foot 

    IA IB IIA IIB IIIA IIIB IV VA VB 

A-1 Assembly, Theaters, with stage 202 195 190 182 172 167 177 157 151 

A-1 
Assembly, Theaters, without 

stage 182 176 171 163 153 148 158 138 132 

A-2 Assembly, nightclubs 155 151 147 141 133 129 136 121 116 

A-2 
Assembly, restaurant, bars, 

banquet hall 154 150 145 140 131 128 135 119 115 

A-3  Assembly, churches 186 179 175 167 156 151 161 141 135 

A-3 Assembly, general, community 

halls, libraries, museums 157 150 145 138 126 122 132 111 106 

A-4 Assembly, arenas 181 175 169 162 151 147 157 136 131 

B Business 154 149 144 137 125 120 132 109 105 

E Educational 171 165 160 153 141 134 147 123 119 

F-1 Factory and industrial,                 

moderate hazard 94 90 85 82 73 70 79 60 57 

F-2 Factory and industrial,                       

low hazard 93 89 85 81 73 69 78 60 56 

H-1 High hazard, explosive 88 84 80 76 69 64 73 56 N.P. 

H-234 High hazard 88 84 80 76 69 64 73 56 51 

H-5 HPM 154 149 144 137 125 120 132 109 105 

I-1 
Institutional, supervised 

environment 159 153 148 142 130 127 138 117 112 

I-2 Institutional, hospitals 260 255 250 243 230 N.P. 238 214 N.P. 

I-2 Institutional, nursing homes 182 176 171 165 153 N.P. 159 137 N.P. 

I-3 Institutional, restrained 178 172 167 160 149 143 155 134 127 

I-4 Institutional, day care facilities 159 153 148 142 130 127 138 117 112 

M Mercantile 115 111 106 101 93 90 97 80 77 

R-1 Residential, hotels 160 154 150 143 132 128 140 118 114 

R-2 Residential, multiple family 134 128 124 117 106 103 114 93 88 

R-3 Residential, one and two family 126 122 119 116 112 109 114 105 98 

R-4 Residential, care/assisted living 

facilities 159 153 148 142 130 127 138 117 112 

S-1 Storage, moderate hazard 87 83 78 75 67 63 72 54 50 

S-2 Storage, low hazard 86 82 78 74 67 62 71 54 49 

U Utility, miscellaneous 68 64 60 57 51 47 54 39 37 

 

VALUATION CHART FOR OTHER 

 
Other Types of Construction Cost per Square Foot 

Tennant Improvement - Vanilla Shell $ 20.00 

Tennant Improvement - Office $ 20.00 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

3 

Tennant Improvement - Restaurant $ 40.00 

Tennant Improvement - Medical $ 50.00 

Residential Patio addition, etc. $ 7.00 

Residential Room Addition, Remodel etc $ 20.00 

Fencing requiring a permit $ 2.00 a Square Foot  

  

 

Section 109.4 is amended as follows: 

 

Section 109.4 Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance.  The following shall be 

added after the last sentence: 

 

This fee shall be equal to double the amount of the Building, Plan Review, Electric, 

Plumbing and Mechanical permit fees required by this code. The payment of such fee shall not 

exempt an applicant from compliance with all other provisions of either this code or other 

requirements, nor from the penalty prescribed by law. 

 

Section 109.6 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 109.6 Refunds.  The building official shall be permitted to authorize refunding 

of a fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected. 

 

The building official shall be permitted to authorize refunding of not more than 80 

percent of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance 

with this code. 

 

The building official shall be permitted to authorize refunding of not more than 80 

percent of the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit for which a plan review fee 

has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any examination time has been expended. 

 

The building official shall not be permitted to authorize refunding of any fee paid except 

upon written application filed by the original permittee not later than 90 days after the date of fee 

payment. 

 

Section 201.3 is deleted in its entirety.  

 

Section 201.4 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 201.4 Terms not defined.  Where terms are not defined through the methods 

authorized by this section, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as the 

context implies.  Webster’s Third New International Dictionary of the English Language, 

Unabridged, shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings. 

 

Section 716.5.4. Exceptions is amended as follows: 

 

Exceptions: Add new exception # 4 to read as follows: 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

4 

4. Such walls are penetrated by ducted HVAC systems, have a required fire-resistance 

rating of 1 hour or less and are in buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler 

system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. For the purposes of this exception, a 

ducted HVAC system shall be a duct system for conveying supply, return or exhaust air as part of 

the structure’s HVAC system. Such a duct system shall be constructed of sheet steel not less than 

26 gage thickness and shall be continuous from the air-handling appliance or equipment to the air 

outlet and inlet terminals. 

 

Section 901.1 Scope.  Is amended as follows: 

 

Section 901.1 Scope.  Add the following paragraph:   

 

Code sections preceded by [F] shall be considered to be maintained and administered 

under the International Fire code. Where there is a conflict regarding fire suppression systems 

and/or alarms between this code and the Fire Code, the Fire Code shall prevail.” 

 

Section 901.5  is amended as follows: 

 

Section 901.5 Acceptance tests.  Delete the last sentence and replace with the following: 

 

“It shall be unlawful to use, occupy, or furnish any portion of a structure until the fire 

protection systems of the structure have been tested and approved.” 

 

Section 1008.1.2 is amended as follows: 

 

Section 1008.1.2 Door swing.  Exception 4 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the 

following: 

 

4. Doors within or serving a single dwelling unit in Groups R-2, R-3 as applicable in 

Section 101.2, and R-4. 

 

Chapter 11 is amended as follows: 

 

Section 1101.1  delete in its entirety and replace with the following: 

 

Section 1101.1 Scope.  The provisions of this chapter and the Arizona Revised Statutes 

(ARS) Section 41-1492 through 41-1492.12 shall control the design and construction of facilities 

for accessibility to physically disabled persons. 

 

Section 1101.2  is deleted in its entirety and replace with the following: 

 

Section 1101.2 Design.  Buildings and facilities shall be designed and constructed to be 

accessible in accordance with this code. ICC A117.1, and in accordance with the provisions of 

the State of Arizona Attorney General Administrative rules R-10-3-401 through R-10-3-404, 

whichever standard provides the greater degree of accessibility. This dual-reference provision 

shall apply in all cases where ICC A117.1 is referenced in this chapter. 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

5 

 

Section 1103.2.6  is amended by adding the following sentences: 

 

“The public portions of temporary sales offices/trailers are required to be accessible. 

There shall be accessible parking and an accessible route from the accessible parking aisle to the 

sales office/trailer and throughout the public portion of the sales office/trailer, including the 

design center. Accessible toilet rooms shall be provided according to this code.” 

 

Section 1109.2.2  is amended by adding the following sentence: 

 

“A baby changing station shall not be located within a water closet stall” 

 

Section 1210.2 is amended as follows: 

 

Section 1210.2 Walls and Partitions:  Walls and partitions within 2 feet (610 mm) of 

service sinks, urinals and water closets shall have a smooth, hard nonabsorbent surface, to a 

height of 4 feet (1219 mm) above the floor and except for structural elements, the materials used 

in such walls shall be of a type that is not adversely affected by moisture. 

 

Revision to Table 1607.1 

 

Revise Table 1607.1 as follows: 

 

OCCUPANCY OR USE UNIFORM 

(psf) 

CONCENTRATED 

(lbs.) 

27. Residential 

          One-and two-family dwellings 

              Uninhabitable attics with limited storage i.j.k. 

              Habitable attics and sleeping areas 

(no other changes in item 27) 

 

 

 

20 40 

30 40 

 

 

 

Section 1704.5 is amended as follows. 

 

Section 1704.5 Masonry Construction:  The following Exceptions shall be added: 

 

Exception 4:  Masonry fences six feet or less in height above grade. 

 

Exception 5:  Masonry retaining walls four feet or less in height from bottom of footing 

to top of wall unless supporting a surcharge or impounding flammable liquids. 

 

Section 3109 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 3109 Swimming Pool Enclosures and Safety Devices.  Swimming pool 

enclosures and safety devices shall be installed pursuant to Arizona Revised Statutes § 36-1681. 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

6 

 

APPENDIX I revision: 

 

Section I104.2 Footings: is deleted in its entirety.  

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

7 

AVONDALE/MAG AMENDMENTS 

TO THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE 

 

The International Residential Code 2009 edition is amended as follows: 

 

Section R101.1 is amended as follows: 

 

Section R101.1 Title.  Insert the words “City of Avondale” as the name of jurisdiction. 

 

Section R102.5 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section R102.5 Appendices.  The following appendices are adopted by the City of 

Avondale:  Appendices A, B, C, G, H, J, K, and P. 

 

APPENDIX G Section AG 105 is deleted in its entirety and replace with the following: 

 

Section AG 105 shall meet the requirements of ARS 36-1681 

 

Section R105.2 is amended as follows: 

 

Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit:  Item #1 under “Building:” is deleted in its 

entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, 

playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 

square feet (11.15m2). 

2. Fences over four (4) foot in height require a permit. 

 

Section R105.3.2 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section R 105.3.2 Time Limitation of application. An application for a permit for any 

proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date of filing, unless 

such application had been pursued in good faith or a permit has been issued; except that the 

building official is authorized to grant one extension of time for a period not to exceed 180 days. 

The extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. Before such work 

recommences, the extension will be granted provided no changes have been made or will be 

made in the original construction documents for such work and provided further that such 

suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year. 

 

Section R108.6 Work commencing before permit issuance: The following shall be added after 

the last sentence: 

 

This fee shall be equal to double the amount of the Building, Plan Review, Electric, 

Plumbing and Mechanical permit fees required by this code. The payment of such fee shall not 

exempt an applicant from compliance with all other provisions of either this code or other 

requirements, nor from the penalty prescribed by law. 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

8 

 

Section R201.4 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section R201.4 Terms not defined.  Where terms are not defined through the methods 

authorized by this section, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as the 

context implies.  Webster’s Third New International Dictionary of the English Language, 

Unabridged, shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Table R301.2(1) is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA 

      Subject To Damage From            

Ground 

Snow 

Load 

Wind 

Speed6    

(mph) 

Seismic 

Design 

Category9 Weathering8 

Frost 

Line 

Depthb Termitec Decayd 

Winter 

Design 

Tempf 

Ice Shield 

Under- 

Layment 

Requiredi 

Flood  

Hazardsh 

Air        

Freezing 

Indexj 

Mean 

Annual 

Tempk 

N/A 

90 mph    

Exposure C B Moderate N/A 

Moderate 

to      

Heavy 

None   

to   

Slight 24˚F   

Jurisdiction 

Specific     

(Footnotes to remain unchanged) 

 

 

 

Table R301.5 is amended to modify the following: 

 

USE LIVE 

LOAD 

Attics with limited storage b,e 20 40 

Habitable attics and attics served with fixed stairs 30 40 

Sleeping rooms 30 40 

(Remainder of Section to remain unchanged) 

 

 

Section R312.2 is amended as follows: 

 

Section R312.2 Guard opening limitations.  The following sentence is added to the end 

of the first paragraph: 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

9 

Required guards shall not be constructed with horizontal rails or other ornamental pattern 

that results in a ladder effect. 

 

Section R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire systems is amended to read as 

follows: 

 

Section R313.2 Two-family dwellings automatic fire systems. An automatic residential 

fire sprinkler system shall be installed in two- family dwellings. 

 

Section R314.3 is amended by adding the following subsection: 

 

4. Where the ceiling height of a room open to the hallway servicing 

bedrooms exceeds that of the hallway by 24 inches or more, smoke 

detectors shall be installed in the hallways and in the adjacent room. 

 

 

Section M1503.1 General. Is amended to read as follows: 

 

Section M1503.1 Range hoods shall discharge to the outdoors through a single wall duct. 

The duct serving the hood shall have a smooth interior surface, shall be airtight, and shall be 

equipped with a backdraft damper. Changes in size or direction shall be accomplished with a pre-

manufactured transition fitting. Ducts serving range hoods shall not terminate in an attic or crawl 

space or areas inside the building.  

 

 

Section M2005.2 Prohibited locations. Is amended to read as follows: 

 

Section M2005.2 Prohibited locations. Fuel-fired water heaters shall not be installed in 

a room used for storage or clothes closet. Water heaters installed in a bedroom or bathroom shall 

be installed in a sealed enclosure so that the combustion air will not be taken from the living 

space. Direct-vent water heaters are not required to be installed within an enclosure. 

 

Section G2415.10 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section G2415.10 (404.10) Minimum burial depth. Underground piping systems shall 

be installed a minimum depth of 12 inches (305 mm) below grade for metal piping and 18 inches 

(457 mm) for plastic piping. 

 

Delete Section G2415.10.1 Individual outside appliances is deleted in its entirety: 

 

Reason: The elimination of the section addressing individual outside appliances is 

because the risks are the same whether the line serves multiple appliances or a single appliance. 

With similar risks, similar depths should be required. 

 

Revision to Section P2803.6.1 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

10 

Revise number 2 of Section P2803.6.1 to read as follows: 

 

2. Discharge through an air gap located in the same room as the water heater except 

where the discharge is to the outdoors, not subject to freezing and the piping 

terminates not less than 6 inches (152 mm) and not more than 12 inches (305mm) 

above grade.  

 

Add number 14 to read: 

 

14. Direct the discharge in a downward direction. 

 

 

APPENDIX H is amended as follows: 

 

Section AH106.1 Footings: is deleted in its entirety. 

 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

11 

AVONDALE/MAG AMENDMENTS 

TO THE 2008 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE 

 

The National Code, 2008 Edition, is amended in the following respects: 

 

Section 80 Administration and Enforcement, is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 90.1 is amended as follows: 

 

Section 90.1(E) Practical Safeguarding.  The following is added after the first 

paragraph: 

 

Any and all electrical work for light, heat, power or any other purposes shall be installed 

in conformity with the rules and regulations as set forth in this Code and that document titled the 

National Electrical Code, 2008 Edition and in conformity with the rules and regulations as set 

forth by the Building Official. 

 

Section 90.1 is amended by adding the following subsections: 

 

(E)  The International Building Code, 2009 Edition, Chapter One, as adopted by the City 

of Avondale and amended from time to time, shall be considered the Administrative Code for 

this sub-section. 

 

Section 90.6 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 90.6 Formal interpretations.  To promote uniformity of interpretation and 

application of the provisions of this Code, Section 113, “Board of Appeals”, of the International 

Building Code, 2009 Edition, as adopted by the City and amended from time to time, shall 

provide established procedures for appeals of interpretation under this Section. 

 

ARTICLE 230 is amended by adding the following section: 

 

Section 230.63 Location.  All service equipment rated 1000 amperes or more located 

inside a building shall be enclosed within a room or space separated from the rest of the building 

by not less than one-hour fire-resistive occupancy separation or fire barrier installed in 

compliance with the building code. 

 

Section 250.118 is amended as follows: 

 

Section 250.118 Types of equipment grounding conductors.  The equipment 

grounding conductor run with or enclosing the circuit conductors shall be one or more or a 

combination of the following: 

 

    FPN: For effective ground-fault current path, see 250.2 Definition. 

 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

12 

(1) A copper, aluminum, or copper-clad aluminum conductor. This conductor shall be solid or 

stranded; insulated, covered, or bare; and in the form of a wire or a busbar of any shape. 

 

(2) Rigid metal conduit. 

 

(3) Intermediate metal conduit. 

 

(4) Electrical metallic tubing with an additional equipment grounding conductor. 

 

(5) Listed flexible metal conduit with an additional equipment grounding conductor, and meeting 

all the following conditions: 

 

a. The conduit is terminated is listed fittings. 

 

b. The combined length of flexible metal conduit and liquidtight flexible metal conduit in the 

same ground return path does not exceed 1.8 m (6 ft) for feeders and 15 m (50 ft) for branch 

circuits 

 

c. The additional equipment grounding conductor is terminated at each termination or junction 

point. 

 

(6) Listed liquidtight flexible metal conduit meeting all the following condition: 

 

a. The conduit is terminated in listed fittings. 

 

b. For metric designators 12 through 16 (trade sizes 3/8 through ½), the circuit conductors 

contained in the conduit are protected by overcurrent devices rated at 20 amperes or less. 

 

c. For metric designators 21 through 35 (trade sizes ¾ through 1-1/4), the circuit conductors 

contained in the conduit are protected by overcurrent devices rated not more than 60 amperes and 

there is no flexible metal conduit, flexible metallic tubing, or liquidtight flexible metal conduit in 

trade sizes metric designators 12 through 16 (trade sizes 3/8 through 11/2) in the grounding path. 

 

d. The combined length of flexible metal conduit and flexible metallic tubing and liquidtight 

flexible metal conduit in the same ground return path does not exceed 1.8 m (6 ft). 

 

e. Where used to connect equipment where flexibility is necessary after installation, and 

equipment grounding conductor shall be installed. 

 

(7) Listed liquidtight flexible metal conduit with an additional equipment grounding conductor 

and meeting all the following conditions: 

 

a. The conduit is terminated in listed fittings. 

 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

13 

b. The combined length of liquidtight flexible metal conduit and flexible metal conduit in the 

same ground return path does not exceed 15 m (50 ft) for branch circuits and 1.8 m (6 ft) for 

feeders. 

 

c. The additional equipment grounding conductor is terminated at each termination or junction 

point.  

 

(8) Flexible metallic tubing where the tubing is terminated in listed fittings and meeting the 

following conditions: 

 

a. The circuit conductors contained in the tubing are protected by overcurrent devices rated at 20 

amperes or less. 

 

b. The combined length of flexible metal conduit and flexible metallic tubing and liquidtight 

flexible metal conduit in the same ground return path does not exceed 1/8 m (6 ft). 

 

(9) Armor of Type AC cable with an additional equipment grounding conductor and as provided 

in 320.108. 

 

(10) The copper sheath of mineral-insulated, metal-sheathed cable. 

 

(11) Type MC cable where listed and identified for grounding in accordance with the following: 

 

a. The combined metallic sheath and grounding conductor of interlocked metal tape-type MC 

cable.  

 

b. The metallic sheath or the combined metallic sheath and grounding conductors of the smooth 

or corrugated tube-type MC cable. 

 

(12) Cable trays as permitted in 392.3 and 392.7. 

 

(13) Cablebus framework as permitted in 370.3. 

 

(14) Other listed electrically continuous metal raceways and listed auxiliary gutters. 

 

(15) Surface metal raceways listed for grounding. 

 

Table 310.15 (B)(6), Conductor Types and Sizes for 120/240-Volt, 3-Wire, Single-

Phase Dwelling Services and Feeders, is deleted in its entirety and replaced with a new Table 

310.15(B)(6) as follows: 

 

 

 

 

 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

14 

 

TABLE 310.15(B)(6) 

 

Conductor (AWG or kemil) 

 

Copper                     Aluminum or                          Service or Feeder Rating (Amperes) 

                            Copper-Clad Aluminum                  < 30 C (80 F)    > 30 C (86 F) 

      4                                     2                                                100               -------- 

      3                                     1                                                110               -------- 

      2                                     1/0                                             125                 100 

      1                                     2/0                                             150                 125 

      1/0                                  3/0                                             175                 150 

      2/0                                  4/0                                             200                 175 

      3/0                                  250                                            225                 200 

      4/0                                  300                                            250                 225 

      250                                 350                                            300                 250 

      350                                 500                                            350                 300 

      400                                 600                                            400                 350 

 

      500                                 750                                             -----                400 

 

 

Section 334.10 is amended as follows: 

 

Section 334.10 Uses Permitted.  Subsection 1 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with 

the following: 

 

(1) One- and two-family dwellings, multi-family dwellings and other residential 

accessory structures.  

 

Section 334.12 is amended as follows: 

 

Section 334.12(A) Types NM, NMC and NMS.  Subsections (2), (3), (4), (5), (6), (7), 

(8) and (9) are deleted in their entirety. 

 

Section 358.10(B) is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 358.10(B) Corrosion Protection. Ferrous or nonferrous EMT, elbows, couplings 

and fittings shall be permitted to be installed in concrete, that is not in direct contact with the 

earth or in areas subject to severe corrosive influences where protected by corrosion protection 

and judged suitable for the condition. 

 

Section 358.12 is amended to add a subsection as follows: 

 

(7).  On or below grade. 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

15 

AVONDALE AMENDMENTS 

TO THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE 

 

The International Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition, is amended in the following respects: 

 

Section 101.1 is amended as follows: 

 

Section 101.1 Title.  Insert the words “City of Avondale” as the name of jurisdiction. 

 

Section 106.4.4 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 106.4.4 Extensions.  An application for a permit for any proposed work shall be 

deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date of filing, unless such application had 

been pursued in good faith or a permit has been issued; except that the building official is 

authorized to grant one extension of time for a period not to exceed 180 days.  The extension 

shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. 

 

Section 106.5.2 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following:  

 

Section 106.5.2 Fee schedule.  All fees shall be in accordance with Chapter One of the 

International Building Code as adopted by the City of Avondale and amended from time to time.  

 

Section 106.5.3 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 106.5.3 Fee refunds.  The code official shall be permitted to authorize refunding 

of a fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected.  

 

The code official shall be permitted to authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of 

the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this 

code. 

 

The code official shall be permitted to authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of 

the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been 

paid is withdrawn or canceled before any examination time has been expended. 

 

The code official shall not be permitted to authorize refunding of any fee paid except 

upon written application filed by the original permittee not later than 90 days after the date of fee 

payment. 

 

Section 108.4 is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 108.5 is amended as follows: 

 

Section 108.5 Stop work order.  The last sentence is amended to read as follows: 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

16 

Any person who shall continue any work on the system after having been served by a stop 

work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or 

unsafe condition, shall be liable for a fine as established by the City of Avondale. 

 

Section 201.4 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 201.4 Terms not defined.  Where terms are not defined through the methods 

authorized by this chapter, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as the 

context implies.  Webster’s Third New International Dictionary of the English Language, 

Unabridged, shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings. 

 

Section 303.3 is amended by adding a new subsection as follows: 

 

6. Fuel fired appliances with natural draft venting shall not be installed in any room 

operating under negative pressure unless the appliances are listed for that use. 

 

Section 307.2.2 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

            Section 307.2.2 Drain pipe materials and sizes. Components of the condensate disposal 

system shall be cast iron, galvanize steel, copper, cross-linked polyethylene, polybutylene, 

polyethylene, ABS CPVC or PVC pipe or tubing. All components shall be selected for the 

pressure and temperature rating of the installation. Condensate waste and drain line size shall be 

not less than 3/4-inch (19 mm) internal diameter and shall not decrease in size from the drain pan 

connection to the place of condensate disposal. Where the drain pipes for more than one unit are 

manifolded together for condensate drainage, the pipe or tubing shall be sized in accordance with 

the following: 

 

EQUIPMENT CAPACITY                                                        MINIMUM CONDENSATE      

                                                                                                                 PIPE DIAMETER 

Up to 20 tons (70.3 lw) of refrigeration                                                 ¾ inch (19 mm)                               

Over 20 tons (70.3 lw) to 40 tons (141 kw) of refrigeration                 1 inch (25 mm) 

Over 40 tons (141 kw) to 90 tons (317 kw) of refrigeration               1 ¼ inch (32 mm) 

Over 90 tons (317 kw) to 125 tons (440 kw) of refrigeration             1 ½ inch (38 mm) 

Over 125 tons (440 kw) to 250 tons (879 kw) of refrigeration             2 inch (51 mm) 

 

Such piping shall maintain a minimum horizontal slope in the direction of discharge of not less 

than one-eight unit vertical in 12 unit’s horizontal (1-percent slope). 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

17 

AVONDALE AMENDMENTS 

TO THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE 

 

The International Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition, is amended in the following respects: 

 

Section 101.1  is amended as follows: 

 

                 Section 101.1 Title.  Insert the words “City of Avondale” as the name of jurisdiction. 

 

Add a new Section 101.5 to read as follows: 

 

Section 101.5 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices shall not apply unless 

specifically adopted. 

 

Section 106.5.4  is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 106.5.4 Extensions.  An application for a permit for any proposed work shall be 

deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date of filing, unless such application had 

been pursued in good faith or a permit has been issued; except that the Building Official is 

authorized to grant one extension of time for a period not to exceed 180 days. The extension shall 

be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. 

 

Section 106.6.3  is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

106.6.3 Fee refunds.  The code official shall be permitted to authorize refunding of a fee 

paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected. 

 

The code official shall be permitted to authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of 

the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this 

code 

 

The code official shall be permitted to authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of 

the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been 

paid is withdrawn or canceled before any examination time has been expended. 

 

The code official shall not be permitted to authorize refunding of any fee paid except 

upon written application filed by the original permittee not later than 90 days after the date of fee 

payment. 

 

Section 108.4  is deleted in its entirety, 

 

Section 108.5  is amended as follows: 

 

Section 108.5 Stop work orders.  The last sentence is amended to read as follows: 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

18 

Any person who shall continue any work on the system after having been served by a stop 

work order except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe 

condition, shall be liable for a fine as established by the City of Avondale. 

 

 

Section 201.4  is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 201.4 Terms not defined.  Where terms are not defined through the methods 

authorized by this chapter, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as the 

context implies. Webster’s Third New International Dictionary of the English Language, 

Unabridged, shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings. 

 

Section 410.1  is amended as follows: 

 

Section 410.1 Approval.  Delete the last sentence and replace with the following: 

 

“In other occupancies, where drinking fountains are required, bottle water dispensers or 

water coolers shall be permitted to be substituted.” 

 

Section 504.6 Requirements for discharge piping is amended as follows: 

 

Revise #2 to read as follows: 

 

2. Discharge through an air gap located in the same room as the water heater except 

where the discharge is to the outdoors, not subject to freezing and the piping terminates not less 

than 6 inches (152mm) and not more than 12 inches (305mm) above grade. 

 

Add # 14 to read as follows: 

 

14. Direct the discharge in a downward direction. 

 

Section 1202 Medical Gases.  Add a new section, as follows: 

 

Section 1202.1.1 Level 3 dental facilities.  Vacuum piping installed under an on grade 

floor shall be installed in compliance with recommendations and drawings prepared by a 

registered design professional and contained within the dental equipment manufacturer’s 

specifications and details, and with the otherwise applicable provisions of NFPA99- 2005. All 

drawings and specifications shall be sufficiently comprehensive as to provide prescriptive 

installation criteria. Special inspection in accordance with IBC Section 1704.1 shall be provided. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

19 

 

AVONDALE AMENDMENTS 

TO THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE 

 

The International Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition, is amended in the following respects: 

 

Section 101.1  is amended as follows: 

 

Section 101.1 Title.  Insert the words “City of Avondale” as the name of jurisdiction. 

 

Section 106.5.4  is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 106.5.4 Extensions.  An application for a permit for any proposed work shall be 

deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date of filing, unless such application had 

been pursued in good faith or a permit has been issue; except that the building official is 

authorized to grant one extension of time for a period not to exceed 180 days. The extension shall 

be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated. 

 

Section 106.6.2   is deleted in its entirety and replace with the following: 

 

Section 106.6.2 Fee schedule.  All fees shall be in accordance with Chapter One of the 

International Building Code as adopted by the City of Avondale and amended from time to time. 

 

Section 106.6.3  is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 106.6.3 Fee refunds.  The code official shall be permitted to authorize refunding 

of a fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected.  

 

The code official shall be permitted to authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of 

the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this 

code. 

 

The code official shall be permitted to authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of 

the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been 

paid is withdrawn or canceled before any examination time has been expended. 

 

The code official shall not be permitted to authorize refunding of any fee paid except 

upon written application filed by the original permitted not late than 90 days after the date of fee 

payment. 

 

Section 108.4  is deleted in its entirety. 

 

Section 108.5  is amended as follows: 

 

Section 108.5 Stop work order.  The last sentence is amended to read as follows: 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

20 

Any person who shall continue any work on the system after having been served by a stop 

work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or 

unsafe condition, shall be liable for a fine as established by the City of Avondale. 

 

Section 201.4  is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Section 201.4 Terms not defined.  Where terms are not defined through the methods 

authorized by this chapter, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as the 

context implies. Webster’s Third New International Dictionary of the English Language, 

Unabridged, shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings. 

 

Section 404.10 Minimum burial depth. Is revised to read as follows: 

 

Section 404.10 Minimum burial depth. Underground piping systems shall be installed a 

minimum depth of 12 inches (305mm) below grad for metal piping and 18 inches (457mm) for 

plastic piping. 

 

Section 404.10.1 Is deleted in its entirety. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



2048.001\AV-MAG Codes.v4.doc 

2-9-03-1 

21 

 

AVNODALE AMENDMENTS 

TO THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE 

 

The International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition, is amended in the following respects: 

 

Section 101.1  is amended as follows: 

 

Section 101.1 Title.  Insert the words “City of Avondale” as the name of jurisdiction. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA

CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS   .   11465 WEST CIVIC CENTER DRIVE   .   AVONDALE, AZ 85323

 
REGULAR MEETING 

December 6, 2010 
7:00 PM 

  CALL TO ORDER BY MAYOR ROGERS 
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
MOMENT OF REFLECTION

 

   

1 ROLL CALL AND STATEMENT OF PARTICIPATION BY THE CITY CLERK

2 UNSCHEDULED PUBLIC APPEARANCES

 (Limit three minutes per person. Please state your name.)  

3 CONSENT AGENDA

 

Items on the consent agenda are of a routine nature or have been previously studied 
by the City Council at a work session. They are intended to be acted upon in one 
motion. Council members may pull items from consent if they would like them 
considered separately.

 

 

a. APPROVAL OF MINUTES 
1. Goal Setting Meeting of November 8, 2010 
2. Work Session of November 15, 2010 
3. Regular Meeting of November 15, 2010 
4. Special Meeting of November 22, 2010 

 

b. SPECIAL EVENT LIQUOR LICENSES - RACEWAY ELKS - FUNDRAISING EVENTS 
City Council will consider two special event liquor license applications from Mr. Gary Bruce on 
behalf of the Raceway Elks #2852 for fundraising events to be held on December 11, 2010 
and December 31, 2010 at the Masonic Temple located at 1015 North 8th Street in Avondale. 
The Council will take appropriate action. 

 

c. FIRST AMENDMENT TO FINANCIAL ASSISTANCE AGREEMENT - CARE1ST HEALTH 
PLAN ARIZONA, INC. 
City Council will consider a request to approve the first amendment to the Financial Assistance 
Agreement with Care1st Health Plan Arizona, Inc. for its funding of the Care1st Avondale 
Resource and Housing Center and authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to 
execute the necessary documents. The Council will take appropriate action. 

 

d. PAYMENT AUTHORIZATION - SOUTHWEST GAS CORPORATION FOR LINE 
RELOCATIONS FOR THE ELM LANE DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENT PROJECT 
City Council will consider a request to authorize payment to Southwest Gas Corporation for 
gas line relocations in the amount of $130,405.91, authorize the transfer of $130,405.91 from 
304-1274-00-8420, Thomas-107th Avenue to Avondale Boulevard to 304-1158-00-8420, Elm 
Lane Drainage Improvements, and authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to 
execute the necessary documents. The Council will take appropriate action.  
 
 

 



 

e. PURCHASE OF FOUR PATROL CARS FOR THE NEW NORTHWEST PUBLIC SAFETY 
FACILITY 
City Council will consider a request to authorize the purchase of four additional police cars to 
assist in the deployment of officers out of the Northwest Public Safety Substation from Five 
Star Ford in the amount of $194,396.68 by attaching to the State of Arizona Contract 
SCC070008-2-A5 and authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the 
necessary documents. The Council will take appropriate action. 

 

f. CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT AWARD - STANDARD CONSTRUCTION COMPANY, INC - 
WELL 5 WELL SITE IMPROVEMENTS 
City Council will consider a request to award a construction contract to Standard Construction 
Company, Inc. for construction of Well 5 well site improvements in the amount of $167,665.71 
and authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the necessary documents. 
The Council will take appropriate action. 

 

g. PURCHASE AGREEMENT - POLYDYNE, INC. 
City Council will consider a request to approve a Purchase Agreement with Polydyne, Inc. for 
the purchase of polymer coagulant for an amount not to exceed $90,000 annually and 
authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the necessary documents. The 
Council will take the appropriate action. 

 

h. RESOLUTION 2936-1210 - INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT - TOLLESON UNION 
HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 214 – TRAFFIC SIGNAL AT WESTVIEW HIGH SCHOOL 
City Council will consider a resolution authorizing an Intergovernmental Agreement with the 
Tolleson Union High School District No. 214 for the construction and installation of a traffic 
signal at Westview High School's northeastern driveway, authorize the transfer of $97,000 
from CIP Street Fund 304-1265, Dysart/McDowell Intersection Improvements to CIP Street 
Fund 204-1273, 107th Ave-Indian School to RID, and authorize the Mayor or City Manager 
and City Clerk to execute the necessary documents. The Council will take appropriate action. 

4 APPOINTMENT OF MEMBERS TO THE CITY'S BOARDS, COMMISSION AND COMMITTEES 
AND TO THE POSITIONS OF CHAIR AND VICE CHAIR OF THE PLANNING COMMISSION

 
City Council will consider the Council Subcommittee's recommendations for appointment to the 
City's Boards, Commissions and Committees and the appointment of two members to serve as 
Chair and Vice Chair of the Planning Commission. The Council will take appropriate action. 

 

5 PUBLIC HEARING - ORDINANCE - USE OF FIREWORKS

 
City Council will consider an ordinance prohibiting the use of fireworks, with the exception of 
novelty items, within the corporate limits of the City of Avondale. The Council will take appropriate 
action. 

 

6 MASTER AND FINAL SITE PLAN APPROVAL EXTENSION - AVONDALE PHOENIX 
CHILDREN’S HOSPITAL

 

City Council will consider a request by Mr. Ivan Hilton, Ensemble Devman of Arizona, to extend 
the validity of the Master and Final Site Plans for the Phoenix Children's Hospital - Avondale 
Campus for one year from the date of expiration, until October 20, 2011. The Council will take 
appropriate action. 

 

7 PUBLIC HEARING - TIME EXTENSION FOR PAPAGO COMMERCE CENTER PAD ZONING

 
City Council will hold a public hearing and consider a request by Mr. Erich Stiger, iStar Financial, 
Inc., to extend the validity of the Papago Commerce Center Planned Area Development (PAD) 
for one year, until October 15, 2011. The Council will take appropriate action. 

 

8 EXECUTIVE SESSION 

 

a. The Council may hold an executive session pursuant to ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 38-431.03 (A)(3) for 
discussion or consultation for legal advice with the City Attorney regarding options for 
addressing Proposition 203 approved by Arizona voters on November 2, 2010.  
 



 

9 ADJOURNMENT  

 Respectfully submitted,   

 

 

  
 
Carmen Martinez 
City Clerk

 

 

Individuals with special accessibility needs, including sight or hearing impaired, large 
print, or interpreter, should contact the City Clerk at 623-333-1200 or TDD 623-333-
0010 at least two business days prior to the Council Meeting. 
 
Personas con necesidades especiales de accesibilidad, incluyendo personas con 
impedimentos de vista u oído, o con necesidad de impresión grande o interprete, 
deben comunicarse con la Secretaria de la Ciudad at 623-333-1200 o TDD 623-333-
0010 cuando menos dos días hábiles antes de la junta del Concejo.

 



CITY COUNCIL REPORT

SUBJECT: 
APPROVAL OF MINUTES 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

 
 

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Carmen Martinez, City Clerk (623) 333-1214

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager

PURPOSE:

1. Goal Setting Meeting of November 8, 2010 
2. Work Session of November 15, 2010 
3. Regular Meeting of November 15, 2010 
4. Special Meeting of November 22, 2010 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

No Attachments Available 

 



CITY COUNCIL REPORT

SUBJECT: 
Special Event Liquor Licenses - Raceway Elks - 

Fundraising Events 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

  

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Carmen Martinez, City Clerk (623) 333-1214

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager

PURPOSE:

Staff is requesting that the City Council consider two special event liquor license applications from 
Mr. Gary Bruce on behalf of the Raceway Elks #2852 for fundraising events to be held on December 
11, 2010 and December 31, 2010 at the Masonic Temple located at 1015 North 8th Street in 
Avondale. 

DISCUSSION:

The City Clerk's Department has received two special event liquor license applications from Mr. Gary 
Bruce, on behalf of the Raceway Elks #2852, to be used in conjunction with the following charitable 
fundraiser events to be held at the Masonic Temple located at 1015 North 8th Street in Avondale, 
AZ. 
 

 
The required fees have been paid. Staff has determined that the applicant is not requesting any city 
support other than normal city services. The Police and Fire Departments have reviewed the 
applications and are recommending approval. Their comments are attached.  
 
Staff reviewed the applications using the 14 factors set forth in Ordinance 1031-04. The findings are 
as noted below:  

1. The event will be restricted to members only  
2. Criminal history of the applicant - A background check of the representative, Mr. Gary Bruce, 

revealed no contact with the Avondale Police Department  
3. The event is a charitable fundraiser  
4. Security measures taken by the applicant - The Police Department has reviewed the security 

plan and determined it to be sufficient  
5. All spirituous liquors will be served  
6. Beverages will be dispensed in disposable cups and cans  
7. There were no neighborhood disturbances associated with the most recent event held in 

October 2010  
8. Event activities will be confined to the Masonic Temple so there is no potential for problems in 

the neighborhood in terms of noise, hours and time of the event  

Date Event Time

December 11, 2010 Christmas Dinner-Dance 
Charitable Fundraiser

5:00 PM to 11:00 PM

December 31, 2010 New Year's Dinner-Dance 
Charitable Fundraiser

5:00 PM to 12:00 AM

 



9. The December 11, 2010 event will last six hours and the December 31, 2010 event will last 
seven hours  

10. Sanitary facilities are available at the temple  
11. Zoning is C-2 Community Commercial and Development Services staff has indicated that the 

proposed use will not result in incompatible land uses  
12. Anticipated total daily attendance is 80 people  
13. Music will be provided by a disc jockey who will use his own sound amplification system  
14. Per the Police Department, traffic control measures will not be necessary  

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff is recommending approval of the two special event liquor license applications from Mr. Gary 
Bruce on behalf of the Raceway Elks #2852 for fundraiser events to be held on December 11, 2010 
and December 31, 2010 at the Masonic Temple located at 1015 North 8th Street Avondale, Arizona. 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

Application - December 11, 2010 event

Departmental Review - December 11, 2010 event

Application - December 31, 2010 event

Departmental Review - December 31, 2010 event



























CITY COUNCIL REPORT

SUBJECT: 
First Amendment to Financial Assistance 

Agreement - Care1st Health Plan Arizona, Inc. 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

  

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Gina Montes, Neighborhood and Family Services Director (623) 333-2727

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager

PURPOSE:

Staff is requesting that the City Council approve the first amendment to the Financial Assistance 
Agreement with Care1st Health Plan Arizona for its funding of the Care1st Avondale Resource and 
Housing Center and authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the necessary 
documents. 

BACKGROUND:

In 2008 Care1st Health Plan Arizona approached the City with the offer to fund a resource center in 
Avondale. With relatively minor renovations the former Old Town library building was converted into 
a resource center. This center provides convenient, comprehensive human and housing services to 
the community by providing space for non-profit organizations to operate. The building annex 
functions as a community meeting room which is used for meetings and events by agencies 
providing services in the center and City staff. 
 
With funding provided by Care1st, Avondale staff will continue to identify needed human and 
housing services and recruit agencies to provide these services. The resource center has 
complemented the revitalization efforts in the Old Town area and has attracted other funding such as 
First Things First. 

DISCUSSION:

The resource center is managed by staff from the Neighborhood and Family Services Department 
and has been in operation since 2008. The Resource Center Coordinator is a City employee and is 
supervised by the City's Social Services manager. This position is responsible for the day to day 
operation of the center. In addition to providing funding for this position, Care1st funds operating 
costs that include janitorial services and supplies, facility and grounds maintenance, office supplies, 
postage/printing, risk management costs, repair and maintenance of equipment, computer 
replacement charges, and utilities. 
 
The following is the division of responsibilities for the center described in the agreement that would 
be renewed with Care1st. 
 
The City of Avondale will provide: 
Use of the Old Town Library building on Western Avenue; 
Use of the furniture currently in the building; 
Recruitment of human service and housing service providers;  
Management of the resource center facility and staff;  
Day to day oversight of Care1st support staff assigned to the resource center;  
Fiscal oversight of the resource center. 

 



 
Care1st will directly provide: 
Operating costs for the period of January 2011 through December 2011;  
Two support staff to serve in a reception/clerical capacity. 
 
Joint City of Avondale and Care1st Responsibilities: 
Create awareness of the services provided at the resource center to residents in the Southwest 
Valley; 
Provide accurate, timely, and comprehensive evaluation data. 
 
At the end of the agreement period, Care1st may choose to withdraw from the venture and take any 
equipment/furniture that they have directly funded. The City may also choose to withdraw from the 
venture, or the agreement may be extended. 

BUDGETARY IMPACT:

No General Purpose Funds are required. Care1st will provide $111,800 for operating costs during 
calendar year 2011. 

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends that the City Council approve the first amendment to the Financial Assistance 
Agreement with Care1st Health Plan Arizona for its funding of the Care1st Avondale Resource and 
Housing Center and authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the necessary 
documents. 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

Agreement



FIRST AMENDMENT 
TO 

FINANCIAL ASSISTANCE AGREEMENT 
BETWEEN 

THE CITY OF AVONDALE 
AND 

CARE 1ST HEALTH PLAN ARIZONA, INC. 
 

THIS FIRST AMENDMENT TO FINANCIAL ASSISTANCE AGREEMENT (this 
“First Amendment”) is made as of December 6, 2010, between the City of Avondale, an Arizona 
municipal corporation (the “City”) and Care 1st Health Plan Arizona, Inc., an Arizona 
corporation (the “Provider”).  The City and Provider are also referred to herein individually as a 
“Party” or collectively as the “Parties”. 
 

RECITALS 
 

A. The City and Provider entered into a Financial Assistance Agreement dated 
November 3, 2008 (the “Agreement”) to establish the Resource Center at the Facility to provide 
the Services to residents of the southwestern valley region.  Capitalized terms herein shall have 
the same meaning as set forth in the Agreement unless otherwise defined herein. 

 
B. The City has determined that additional financial assistance is necessary to 

continue the Services, operate the Resource Center, and improve and maintain the Facility for an 
additional year (the “Continued Services”). 

 
C. The City and the Provider desire to enter into this First Amendment to renew the 

Agreement for an additional year and to provide for additional funding for the Continued 
Services. 
 

AGREEMENT 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregoing recitals, which are incorporated 
herein by reference, the following mutual covenants and conditions, and other good and valuable 
consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which is hereby acknowledged, the City and the 
Provider hereby agree as follows: 
 

1. Term of Agreement.  The term of the Agreement is hereby extended from January 
1, 2011 through December 31, 2011 (the “Renewal Term”).  The Parties may renew this First 
Amendment and the Agreement for successive additional time periods at any time prior to the 
expiration of the Renewal Term by written amendment. 

 
2. Compensation.  The Provider shall provide additional funding to the City in the 

amount of $111,800.00 to enable the City to provide the Continued Services (the “Additional 
Funding”).  Provider shall pay one half of the Additional Funding to the City on January 1, 2011.  
Provider shall pay the remaining half of the Additional Funding to the City on June 1, 2011.   

 



1363283.1 

2 

3. Effect of Amendment.  In all other respects, the Agreement is affirmed and 
ratified and, except as expressly modified herein, all terms and conditions of the Agreement shall 
remain in full force and effect. 

 
4. Non-Default.  By executing this First Amendment, each Party affirmatively 

asserts that the other Party is not currently in default, nor has been in default at any time prior to 
this First Amendment, under any of the terms or conditions of the Agreement. 

 
5. Conflict of Interest.  This First Amendment and the Agreement may be cancelled 

pursuant to ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 38-511. 
 
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this instrument as of the date 

and year first set forth above. 
 

“City”       “Provider” 
 
CITY OF AVONDALE, an Arizona   CARE 1ST HEALTH PLAN ARIZONA, 
municipal corporation     INC., an Arizona corporation 
 
 
       By:       
Charles P. McClendon, City Manager 
 
ATTEST:      Name:       
 
 
       Title:       
Carmen Martinez, City Clerk 
 



1363283.1 

3 

(ACKNOWLEDGEMENTS) 
 
 
STATE OF ARIZONA ) 

) ss. 
COUNTY OF MARICOPA ) 
 

This instrument was acknowledged before me on      , 2010, 
by       as        of CARE 1ST 
HEALTH PLAN ARIZONA, INC., an Arizona corporation, on behalf of such corporation. 
 
 

       
Notary Public in and for the State of Arizona 

My Commission Expires: 
 
 
     
 
 
STATE OF ARIZONA ) 

) ss. 
COUNTY OF MARICOPA  ) 
 

This instrument was acknowledged before me on      , 2010, 
by Charles P. McClendon, the City Manager of the CITY OF AVONDALE, an Arizona 
municipal corporation, on behalf of the City of Avondale. 
 
 

       
Notary Public in and for the State of Arizona 

 
My Commission Expires: 
 
 
     



CITY COUNCIL REPORT

SUBJECT: 
Payment Authorization - Southwest Gas 

Corporation for Line Relocations for the Elm Lane 

Drainage Improvement Project 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

 
 

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Sue McDermott, PE, Director of Development Services & Engineering, 623-333-4211

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager

PURPOSE:

Staff is requesting that the City Council approve payment to Southwest Gas Corporation (SWG) for 
gas line relocations in the amount of $130,405.91, authorize the transfer of $130,405.91 from 304-
1274-00-8420, Thomas-107th Avenue to Avondale Boulevard to 304-1158-00-8420, Elm Lane 
Drainage Improvements, and authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the 
necessary documents. 

BACKGROUND:

On October 15, 2007, City Council approved an Intergovernmental Agreement (IGA) with Flood 
Control District of Maricopa County (FCDMC) to cost share on drainage improvements on Elm Lane 
and Central Avenue. On July 21, 2008, City Council approved a Professional Services Agreement 
(PSA) with Entellus Engineering, Inc. to provide design services for drainage improvements on Elm 
Lane and Central Avenue in the amount of $210,886. On September 14, 2009, City Council 
approved a Construction Contract to J.J. Sprague of Arizona, Inc. for the Elm Lane and Central 
Avenue Drainage Improvements for $1,255,993.20. 

DISCUSSION:

Due to conflicts between the existing residential gas service lines and the proposed storm drain 
facilities, the City requested that SWG relocate their facilities at thirteen (13) locations. 

BUDGETARY IMPACT:

Funding in the amount of $130,405.91 is available in CIP Street Fund Line Item 304-1274-00-8420, 
Thomas-107th Avenue to Avondale Boulevard and is proposed to be transferred to CIP Street Fund 
Line Item 304-1158-00-8420, Elm Lane Drainage Improvements.  
 
The FCDMC has agreed to cost share in the utility relocations for the Elm Lane Drainage 
Improvements project. In accordance with the IGA between the City and FCDMC, FCDMC will 
reimburse the City 50% of the $130,405.91 or $65,202.96. 

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends that the City Council approve payment to Southwest Gas Corporation for gas line 
relocations in the amount of $130,405.91, authorize the transfer of $130,405.91 from 304-1274-00-
8420, Thomas-107th Avenue to Avondale Boulevard to 304-1158-00-8420, Elm Lane Drainage 
Improvements, and authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the necessary 
documents.  
 

 



ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

Vicinity Map

SWG Invoice



Western  Ave

Main S
t

C
e
n

tr
a

l 
 A

v
e

This Project

I
City of Avondale

Vicinity Map
Elm Lane Drainage Project





CITY COUNCIL REPORT

SUBJECT: 
Purchase of Four Patrol Cars for the New 

Northwest Public Safety Facility 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

  

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Kevin Kotsur, Chief of Police (623) 333-7201

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager

PURPOSE:

The Police Department is requesting authorization to purchase four additional patrol Crown Victoria 
cars in order to assist in the deployment of officers out of the Northwest Public Safety Substation and 
to ease the shortage of police cars during certain times. The funds to purchase the cars will be taken 
from salary savings. 

BACKGROUND:

Each year the Police Department works with Fleet Services to determine whether additional police 
vehicles need to be added to the current fleet. This evaluation is based on the officer to patrol car 
ratio, as well as the number of police stations that need cars. With the economic situation at hand, 
this past year the Police Department has worked to stretch the current fleet of patrol cars between 
the main police station and the two substations (Western and Cashion). However, with the newest 
substation opening at the Northwest Public Safety Facility the need to add additional patrol cars to 
the fleet is necessary, in order to deploy officers out of the substation. In addition, vacancies within 
the police department have almost been eliminated which means patrol squads are full, which places 
a great demand on the police fleet. No patrol cars have been added to the fleet since 2008. 

DISCUSSION:

It has been determined that four additional patrol cars need to be purchased in order to staff and 
deploy officers out of the Northwest Public Safety Substation and ease the shortage of cars during 
critical times. Funding is available from Police Department salary savings as a result of a few 
positions in the Police Department that have not been filled and overtime savings.  
 
These cars are available on Arizona State Contract SCC070008-2-A5. The four Ford Police cars will 
cost $194,396.68. These prices include the law enforcement/emergency packages, taxes and fees. 
The breakdown by vendor and type of car is as follows:  
 

 
 

Vendor Car Type Unit Cost # of Units Total Cost

Five Star Ford Crown Victoria $26,757.76 4 $107,031.04

Focus Complete Car Paint $686.63 4 $2,746.52

First In, Inc Police Pkg Equip $8,154.78 4 $32,619.12

Computer Dell $8,500.00 4 $34,000.00

Radio Motorola $4,500.00 4 $18,000.00

 



BUDGETARY IMPACT:

The request for the purchase of four additional police cars in the amount of $194,396.68 will be 
funded through the transfer from various salary line items to the vehicle purchase account 235-6174-
00-8120. 

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff requests Council authorize the purchase of four additional police cars from Five Star Ford in the 
amount of $194,396.68 by attaching to the State of Arizona Contract SCC070008-2-A5 and 
authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the necessary documents. 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

No Attachments Available 



CITY COUNCIL REPORT

SUBJECT: 
Construction Contract Award - Standard 

Construction Company, Inc - Well 5 Well Site 

Improvements 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

 
 

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Wayne Janis, Public Works Director (623) 333-4444

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager

PURPOSE:

Staff is requesting that the City Council award a construction contract to Standard Construction 
Company, Inc. for construction of Well 5 well site improvements in the amount of $167,665.71 and 
authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the necessary documents. 

BACKGROUND:

Well 5 (Mountain View Well) and the reservoir at this site was originally converted from a water 
supply well to an irrigation supply well due to water quality issues. See attached vicinity map. The 
well supplied water for Festival Fields Park irrigation. The well was having difficulty due to sanding, 
and was taken out of service. Water for the reservoir was supplied from the domestic water lines until 
the well could be repaired. Since that time, the well was relined to contain the sanding. The use of 
the well will free a large quantity of water in the domestic City system. On May 17, 2010 City Council 
approved a Professional Services Agreement with Dibble Corporation for the design and 
construction support services of well head improvements for Well 5. This contract will construct the 
well site improvements.

DISCUSSION:

The scope of this project will include construction of a well pump, yard piping, site improvements and 
electrical and control improvements for Well 5. Invitation-for-Bid notices were published in the West 
Valley View on October 26, 2010 and November 2, 2010 and in the Arizona Business Gazette on 
October 28, 2010. A mandatory pre-bid meeting was held on November 8, 2010. Five (5) bids were 
received and opened on November 17, 2010. Each bid package was reviewed and all met the 
bidding requirements. The bids ranged from approximately $168,000 to $215,000. Firms submitting 
the lowest four bids and the amount of their bids are as follows: 
 

 
The attached Bid Tabulation Sheet has the detailed bid item breakdown of each submitted bid. 
Standard Construction Company, Inc with a bid of $167665.71 was determined to have submitted 
the lowest responsive bid. Staff contacted references provided and Standard Construction Company, 
Inc. did receive positive recommendations. Standard Construction Company, Inc. has completed 

Standard Construction Company, Inc $167,665.71 

Citywide Contracting LLC $188,700.00 

Felix Construction Company $193,160.00 

Weber Group LC $212,151.00 

 



similar work. Staff contacted the Registrar of Contractors and found no claims on file against this 
contractor. Staff determined that Standard Construction Company, Inc. is competent and qualified for 
this project. A tentative construction schedule is as follows: 
 

City Council Approval 12/13/10 

Notice of Award 12/14/10

Notice to Proceed 1/10/11

Completion 5/10/11 

BUDGETARY IMPACT:

Funding of $168,000 is currently available for the project in 514-1057-00-8520. 

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends that the City Council award a construction contract to Standard Construction 
Company, Inc. for construction of Well 5 well site improvements in the amount of $167,665.71 and 
authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the necessary documents. 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

Vicinity Map

Bid Tabulation



Western  Ave

M
ain

 S
t

C
e
n

tr
a

l 
 A

v
e

L
it

c
h

fi
e
ld

  
 R

d

A
v
o

n
d

a
le

 B
lv

d

Broadway Rd

D
y
s

a
rt

  
R

d

Lower Buckeye Rd

E
l 

 M
ir

a
g

e
  

 R
d

D
y
s

a
rt

  
R

d

Van Buren St

A
v
o

n
d

a
le

 B
lv

d

1
1

9
th

 A
v

e

MC 85/Buckeye Rd

This Project

E
l 

 M
ir

a
g

e
  

 R
d

November 2010  - GIS Division of Public Works

VICINITY MAPVICINITY MAP

Well 5



WA1160 - Well No. 5 Well Site Improvements

BID OPENING DATE: November 17, 2010

Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total

Item 

No.

Description of Materials and/or 

Services
Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

1 Mobilization/Dembilization 1 LS $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $45,052.00 $45,052.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00

2 Allowance for Extra Work 1 Allowance $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

3

Removal of Yard Piping and Booster 

Pumps 1 LS $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $4,300.00 $4,300.00 $1,625.00 $1,625.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00

4 Removal of Concrete Slab 1 LS $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $350.00 $350.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $800.00 $800.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

5 Salvaging Itmes 1 LS $800.00 $800.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $375.00 $375.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00

6 Temporary Water Supply 1 LS $400.00 $400.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $575.00 $575.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

7 Vertical Turbin Pump and Motor 1 LS $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $43,000.00 $43,000.00 $47,900.00 $47,900.00 $39,995.00 $39,995.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00

8 Yard Piping 1 LS $33,000.00 $33,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $37,400.00 $37,400.00 $22,024.00 $22,024.00 $58,000.00 $58,000.00

9 Concrete Slabs 7 SY $175.00 $1,225.00 $250.00 $1,750.00 $400.00 $2,800.00 $500.00 $3,500.00 $100.00 $700.00

10 Identification Sign 1 LS $700.00 $700.00 $500.00 $500.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $500.00 $500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00

11 Electrical Demolition 1 LS $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

12

Motor Control Panel 

Relocation/Rehabilitation 1 LS $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00

13

RTU Logic Controller 

Relocation/Rehabilitation 1 LS $4,900.00 $4,900.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $4,700.00 $4,700.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00

14 Antenna Foundation and Pole 1 LS $700.00 $700.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $2,600.00 $2,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00

15 Electrical Improvements 1 LS $11,500.00 $11,500.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $25,100.00 $25,100.00 $21,300.00 $21,300.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00

16 Programming 1 LS $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $19,600.00 $19,600.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00

17 Community Relations 1 Allowance $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

SUBTOTAL $157,625.00 $178,800.00 $184,300.00 $199,446.00 $214,200.00

TAXES (As Applicable) $10,040.71 $9,900.00 $8,860.00 $12,705.00 $1,000.00

TOTAL SUBMITTED BY BIDDER $167,665.71 $188,700.00 $193,160.00 $212,151.00 $215,200.00

Required Attachments included? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

City of Avondale IFB 11-020

Spire EngineeringStandard Construction City Wide Contracting Weber GroupFelix Construction Company

[1] of 1 



CITY COUNCIL REPORT

SUBJECT: 
Purchase Agreement - Polydyne, Inc. 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

 
 

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Wayne Janis, Public Works Director (623) 333-4444

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager

PURPOSE:

Staff is requesting that the City Council authorize a Purchase Agreement with Polydyne, Inc. for the 
purchase of Polymer Coagulant for the Charles M. Wolf Water Resource Center for an amount not to 
exceed $90,000 annually, and to authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the 
necessary documents. 

BACKGROUND:

The dewatering process requires the addition of polymer coagulant to improve the sludge formation 
and the water quality of the discharge. After the polymer coagulant is added to the sludge, a 
centrifuge separates the water from the solids of the sludge, and the solids are ready for final 
disposal. 

DISCUSSION:

Pima County, Arizona has secured a contract price with Polydyne, Inc. for the purchase of polymer 
coagulant. The polymer coagulant that Pima County uses is the same polymer coagulant that the 
water resource center uses in its sludge dewatering process. The term of this contract will be from 
December 6, 2010 through December 6, 2011 with (4) annual options to renew for a cumulative 
contract pricing of $450,000. The Pima County contract was competitively advertised and bid in 
conformance with Avondale's procurement requirements. Polydyne, Inc., and Pima County have 
agreed to extend the contract price to the City of Avondale. 

BUDGETARY IMPACT:

Funding for this contract will be from line item 503-9230-00-7150. 

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends that the City Council authorize the purchase of Polymer Coagulant f or use in the 
Charles M. Wolf Water Resource Center from Polydyne, Inc., using a Pima County contract, for an 
amount not to exceed $90,000 annually and to authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk 
to execute the necessary documents. 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

Purchase Agreement

 



1369174.1 

PURCHASE AGREEMENT 

BETWEEN 

THE CITY OF AVONDALE 

AND  

POLYDYNE, INC. 

 
THIS PURCHASE AGREEMENT (this “Agreement’) is entered into as of December 6, 

2010, between the City of Avondale, an Arizona municipal corporation (the “City”) and 
Polydyne, Inc., a Delaware corporation (the “Vendor”). 
 

RECITALS 
 

A. Pima County, Arizona, entered into contract #B508065, dated October 19, 2010 
(the “County Contract”), for the Vendor to provide polyelectrolyte cationic dry polymer (the 
“Materials”).  The County Contract is attached hereto as Exhibit A and incorporated herein by 
reference. 

 
B. The City is permitted to purchase the Materials under the County Contract 

without further public bidding, and the County Contract permits its cooperative use by other 
public entities including the City. 

 
C. The City desires to purchase the Materials from the Vendor under the terms and 

conditions of the County Contract for a lower cost than would otherwise be available. 
 

AGREEMENT 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregoing recitals, which are incorporated 
herein by reference, the following mutual covenants and conditions, and other good and valuable 
consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which is hereby acknowledged, the City and the 
Vendor hereby agree as follows: 

 
1. Term of Agreement.  This Agreement shall be effective as of the date first set 

forth above and shall remain in full force and effect until December 6, 2011 (the “Initial Term”), 
unless terminated as otherwise provided pursuant to the terms and conditions of the County 
Contract.  After the expiration of the Initial Term, this Agreement may be renewed for up to 
three additional one-year terms (each a “Renewal Term”) if (a) it is deemed in the best interests 
of the City, subject to availability and appropriation of funds for renewal in each subsequent year 
and (b) the term of the County Contract has been extended pursuant to its renewal options.  
Renewal of this Agreement shall occur upon the City’s written notice to the Vendor given not 
later than 30 days prior to the end of the then-current term.  Upon renewal, the terms and 
conditions of this Agreement shall remain in full force and effect. 

 
2. Scope of Work.  Vendor shall provide the City with the Materials on an as-needed 

basis pursuant to purchase orders issued by the City, at the rates and under the terms and 
conditions of the County Contract, attached hereto as Exhibit A. 

 



1369174.1 

2 

3. Compensation.  The City shall pay Vendor an annual aggregate amount not to 
exceed $90,000.00 for the Materials at the rates as set forth in the County Contract and in the 
quantities as set forth in purchase orders issued by the City. 

 
4. Payments.  The City shall pay the Vendor based upon materials delivered and 

work performed to date, and upon submission and approval of invoices.  All invoices shall 
document and itemize all work completed to date.  The invoice statement shall include a record 
of time expended and work performed in sufficient detail to justify payment. 

 
5. Scrutinized Business Operations.  Pursuant to ARIZ. REV. STAT. §§ 35-391.06 and 

35-393.06, the Vendor certifies that it does not have scrutinized business operations in Sudan or 
Iran.  For the purpose of this subsection the term “scrutinized business operations” shall have the 
meanings set forth in ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 35-391 or 35-393, as applicable.  If the City determines 
that the Vendor submitted a false certification, the City may impose remedies as provided by law 
including terminating this Agreement. 

 
6. Conflict of Interest.  This Agreement may be cancelled by the City pursuant to 

ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 38-511. 
 
7. Applicable Law; Venue.  In the performance of this Agreement, Vendor shall 

abide by and conform to any and all laws of the United States, State of Arizona and City of 
Avondale, including but not limited to, federal and state executive orders providing for equal 
employment and procurement opportunities, the Federal Occupational Safety and Health Act and 
any other federal or state laws applicable to this Agreement.  This Agreement shall be governed 
by the laws of the State of Arizona and a suit pertaining to this Agreement may be brought only 
in courts in the State of Arizona. 

 
8. Agreement Subject to Appropriation.  The provisions of this Agreement for 

payment of funds by the City shall be effective when funds are appropriated for purposes of this 
Vendor and are actually available for payment.  The City shall be the sole judge and authority in 
determining the availability of funds under this Agreement and the City shall keep the Vendor 
fully informed as to the availability of funds for the Agreement.  The obligation of the City to 
make any payment pursuant to this Agreement is a current expense of the City, payable 
exclusively from such annual appropriations, and is not a general obligation or indebtedness of 
the City.  If the City Council fails to appropriate money sufficient to pay the amounts as set forth 
in this Agreement during any immediately succeeding fiscal year, this Agreement shall terminate 
at the end of then-current fiscal year and the City and the Vendor shall relieved of any 
subsequent obligation under this Agreement. 

 
9. Indemnification; Insurance.  The City shall be afforded all of the rights, privileges 

and indemnifications afforded to Pima County under the County Contract, and such rights, 
privileges and indemnifications shall accrue and apply with equal effect to the City under this 
Agreement including, but not limited to, the Vendor’s obligation to provide the indemnification 
and insurance. 

 



1369174.1 

3 

10. Conflicting Terms.  In the event of any inconsistency, conflict or ambiguity 
between this Agreement and the County Contract, the documents shall govern in the order listed 
herein. 

 
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this Agreement as of the date 

and year first set forth above. 
 
“City”       “Vendor” 
 
CITY OF AVONDALE, an Arizona   POLYDYNE, INC., a Delaware corporation 
municipal corporation 
 
 
       By:       
Charles P. McClendon, City Manager 
 
ATTEST:      Name:       
 
 
       Title:       
Carmen Martinez, City Clerk 
 
 



1369174.1 

EXHIBIT A 
TO 

PURCHASE AGREEMENT 
BETWEEN  

THE CITY OF AVONDALE 
AND 

POLYDYNE, INC. 
 

[County Contract] 
 

See following pages. 



B L A N K E T  C O N T R A C T  D O C U M E N T
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Submitted by: HHOUSTON Synergen, Inc.

Report p_rpt206 6.4vPage 1 of 1

Line Qty UOP Stock Code Unit Price Total Price Vendor Model No Vendor Part No Quote No Quote Item 

Blanket Contract Notes:

Type Description 

VENDOR This Blanket Contract is a result of IFB 1100249 and all terms and conditions apply.  According to the terms and conditions of
the bid and to be compliant with Pima County Procurement policies and procedures you must have a Purchase Order in issued
status prior to the delivery of goods and/or services. The status is printed on each Purchase Order.

.

Standard Notes: 

Type Description

PURCH This Purchase Order or Blanket Contract incorporates the attached Specification and Payment documents, and by reference all
Instructions, Standard Terms and Conditions, Special Terms and Conditions, and requirements that are included in or referenced
by the solicitation documents used to establish this agreement. All transactions and conduct are required to conform to these
documents.

Approved/Issued By: 

Pima County Procurement Department   

130 W. Congress Street, 3rd Floor 

Tucson, AZ  85701 

Main Phone: 520-740-8161 

V

E

N
D

O

R

S

S
U

E

D

 

 
B

Y

19-OCT-10 08:42 AMHAZEL HOUSTON

1 CHEMICAL PLANT ROAD

I

Blanket No: B508065 Rev No: 000

Limit Amount:  $350,000.00

Used Amount: 

Initiation Date: 12/12/2010

Expiration Date: 12/11/2011

Extended Date: 

Terms: NET 30

FOB: FOB DEST/NO INVOICE

Blanket Category: 0885

Solicitation: 1100249

Buyer: HAZEL HOUSTON

00001

00003

00002

LB

LB

LB

 $1.7000

 $1.7000

 $1.7000

Description: 

Description: 

Description: 

Clarifloc, Bag, 1200 Lb* WE-443

Clarifloc, Bag, 55 Lb  C-3272

Clarifloc, Bag, 1200 Lb C-3272

Contract Desc: Clarifloc WE-443/C-3272 SS 1100249 (BOS)

RICEBORO,GA 31323

POLYDYNE INC

 

Email transmission constitutes contract execution.































CITY COUNCIL REPORT

SUBJECT: 
Resolution 2936-1210 - Intergovernmental 

Agreement - Tolleson Union High School District 

No. 214 – Traffic Signal at Westview High School 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

 
 

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Sue McDermott, P.E., Director of Development Services & Engineering, 623-333-4211

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager

PURPOSE:

Staff is requesting that the City Council adopt a resolution authorizing an Intergovernmental 
Agreement (IGA) between the City of Avondale and the Tolleson Union High School District (TUHSD 
or District) No. 214 for the construction and installation of a traffic signal at Westview's High School's 
northeastern driveway, authorize the transfer of $97,000 from CIP Street Fund 304-1265, 
Dysart/McDowell Intersection Improvements to CIP Street Fund, 304-1273, 107th Ave - Indian 
School to RID and authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the necessary 
documents. 

BACKGROUND:

In 2008, at the request of the TUHSD and the high school administration, the City of Avondale 
conducted a traffic engineering safety study for Westview High School. The school is located on the 
northwest corner of 107th Avenue and Garden Lakes Parkway. The study included a signal warrant 
analysis. The conclusion of the study was that a traffic signal at the school's northeastern driveway 
was warranted.  
 
The results of the study were provided to TUHSD. At that time, the school was notified that the cost 
of the signal system design and installation would be the responsibility of the school district. 
Additionally, the design of the traffic signal infrastructure shall incorporate safety measures for the 
close proximity of this signal system to existing commercial driveways.  
 
In 2010, TUHSD notified the City that funding was available and that the project was ready to move 
forward. TUHSD provided options to the City addressing access control with the existing commercial 
driveways. The District notified local business owners regarding the project and the potential impact 
to their businesses. No negative feedback was received.  
 
The District hired a consultant to provide design services for the traffic signal infrastructure. The 
consultant has submitted construction documents to the City for review and approval. Upon 
approval, the project documents will be included with the City's planned capital improvements to 
107th Avenue in the same area. 

DISCUSSION:

The proposed IGA with TUHSD establishes the District's responsibilities including: funding and 
management of the design contract for the traffic signal and associated infrastructure and 
preparation of the Temporary Construction Easement documentation. The District will sign a 
Temporary Construction Easement to allow the City's contractor access to the District property which 
is necessary for the installation of the traffic signal equipment. The District will also be responsible for 

 



the preparation of legal documents and the negotiation of the necessary entrance/maintenance 
agreement with the Roosevelt Irrigation District (RID). This is for the portion adjacent to the RID's 
right-of-way.  
 
The City will move forward with the traffic signal infrastructure as part of the CIP improvements in the 
same area and will have ownership and maintenance of the traffic signal system. 

BUDGETARY IMPACT:

The current Capital Improvement Program includes a project to improve 107th Avenue from the RID 
to Indian School Road. The traffic signal was designed by a consultant under contract with the 
school and reviewed and approved by staff. These plans will be incorporated, constructed and paid 
for through the 107th Avenue project. In order to pre-purchase the necessary equipment, $97,000 is 
proposed to be transferred from CIP Street Fund 304-1265, Dysart/McDowell Intersection 
Improvements to CIP Street Fund, 304-1273, 107th Ave - Indian School to RID. In accordance with 
the IGA, upon project completion the school will reimburse the City for all costs incurred by the City 
to construct and install this traffic signal and will provide all necessary temporary and permanent 
easements at no cost to the City.  
 
Future electrical costs and maintenance will be funded through the City's budget. 

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends that the City Council adopt a resolution authorizing an Intergovernmental 
Agreement (IGA) between the City of Avondale and the Tolleson Union High School District (TUHSD 
or District) No. 214 for the construction and installation of a traffic signal at Westview High School's 
northeastern driveway, authorize the transfer of $97,000 from CIP Street Fund 304-1265, 
Dysart/McDowell Intersection Improvements to CIP Street Fund, 304-1273, 107th Ave - Indian 
School to RID, and authorize the Mayor or City Manager and City Clerk to execute the necessary 
documents. 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

Resolution 

Vicinity Map



1350407.1 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

RESOLUTION NO. 2936-1210 

 
A RESOLUTION OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AVONDALE, 
ARIZONA, APPROVING AN INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT 
WITH TOLLESON UNION HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 214 RELATING 
TO THE TRAFFIC SIGNAL INFRASTRUCTURE. 
 
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AVONDALE as follows: 
 
SECTION 1.  The Intergovernmental Agreement with Tolleson Union High School 

District No. 214 relating to construction and installation of traffic signal infrastructure at the 
intersection of 107th Avenue and North High School Drive (the “Agreement”) is hereby 
approved in substantially the form attached hereto as Exhibit A. 

 
SECTION 2.  The Mayor, the City Manager, the City Clerk and the City Attorney are 

hereby authorized and directed to take all steps necessary to cause the execution of the 
Agreement and to take all steps necessary to carry out the purpose and intent of this Resolution. 

 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Council of the City of Avondale, December 6, 2010. 

 
 
 

       
Marie Lopez Rogers, Mayor 

 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
       
Carmen Martinez, City Clerk 
 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
 
       
Andrew J. McGuire, City Attorney    



1350407.1 

EXHIBIT A 
TO 

RESOLUTION NO. 2936-1210 
 

(Agreement) 
 

See following pages. 



1346961.4 

INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT 
BETWEEN 

TOLLESON UNION HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 214 
AND  

THE CITY OF AVONDALE 
 

THIS INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT (this “Agreement”) is entered into as 
of December 6, 2010 between the City of Avondale, an Arizona municipal corporation (the 
“City”), and the Tolleson Union High School District #214 of Maricopa County, a political 
subdivision of the State of Arizona (the “District”).  The City and the District are referred to 
herein collectively as the “Parties” and individually as a “Party.” 
 

RECITALS 
 

A. The District requested that the City construct and install a traffic signal and 
related site improvements (including traffic control striping along North High School Drive) at 
the intersection of 107th Avenue and North High School Drive in connection with planned 
capital improvements to 107th Avenue in the same area (the “Traffic Signal Infrastructure”). 

 
B. The City and the District desire to cooperate on the construction and installation 

of the Traffic Signal Infrastructure in connection with planned capital improvements to 107th 
Avenue in the same area, as depicted on the Vicinity Map, attached hereto as Exhibit A and 
incorporated herein by reference. 

 
C. The City and the District are authorized to enter into this Agreement under the 

authority of ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 11-951 et seq. and ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 15-342(13). 
 
D. The Parties desire to incorporate the Traffic Signal Infrastructure into the City’s 

107th Avenue Improvements and to enter into this Agreement to define the terms and conditions 
under which the Traffic Signal Infrastructure is to be designed, constructed, financed, and 
maintained. 

 
AGREEMENT 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregoing recitals, which are incorporated 

herein by reference, the following mutual covenants and conditions, and other good and valuable 
consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which is hereby acknowledged, the City and the 
District hereby agree as follows: 
 

1. Development of the Traffic Signal Infrastructure. 
 
1.1 Public Procurement.  The City and the District each confirm that any 

procurement related to the Traffic Signal Infrstructure shall be performed in a manner as 
prescribed by law, for all architects, engineers, contractors and other professionals as are 
necessary to design, construct and install the Traffic Signal Infrastructure. 

 



1346961.4 

2 

1.2 Design; Construction Plans.  The District shall be responsible for 
providing the design of the Traffic Signal Infrastructure.  The City shall have no liability to the 
District or under any contract with respect to the design of the Traffic Signal Infrastructure.  The 
plans, specifications, and other construction documents for the Traffic Signal Infrastructure shall 
be the responsibility of the District.  The City shall have the opportunity to comment on the final 
plans and specifications for the Traffic Signal Infrastructure.  If the District receives no 
comments on the final plans and specifications within 15 calendar days following delivery to the 
City, the City will be deemed to have approved the final plans and specifications (such approved 
plans and specifications are referred to herein as the “Construction Plans”). 

 
1.3 Construction. 

 
A. The City shall generally be responsible for the construction of the 

Traffic Signal Infrastructure.  The construction contract shall comply with the provisions of 
AIRZ. REV. STAT., Title 34.  The City shall be the “owner” and obligated party under the 
construction contracts for the Traffic Signal Infrastructure.  The District shall have no liability 
under the contracts relating to the construction of the Traffic Signal Infrastructure on or within 
City right-of-way. 

 
B. Construction of the Traffic Signal Infrastructure will require a 

Temporary Construction Easement granted by the District to the City in substantially the form 
attached hereto as Exhibit B and incorporated by reference.  The District agrees to sign the 
Temporary Construction Easement within five days of full execution of this Agreement by the 
Parties. 

 
C. The District, at its sole cost and expense, shall be responsible for 

negotiating a permanent, non-exclusive easement granted by the Roosevelt Irrigation District 
(the “RID”) in favor of the City, which allows the City to construct portions of the Traffic Signal 
Infrastructure upon or within real property or right-of-way owned by RID (the “RID Easement”). 
 The District, also at its sole cost and expense, shall be responsible for preparing any legal 
descriptions necessary for the proper negotiation of the RID Easement. 

 
1.4 Reimbursement for Construction. 
 

A. The City has procured and will proceed with construction of the 
Traffic Signal Infrastructure in connection with planned capital improvements to 107th Avenue 
in the same area.  Upon satisfactory completion of the construction and installation of the Traffic 
Signal Infrastructure, the District agrees to reimburse the City in the amount of the actual costs 
of the Traffic Signal Infrastructure only, the current cost estimate of which is set forth for 
illustrative purposes only on Exhibit C, attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference.  
The District agrees to pay the actual costs of the Traffic Signal Infrastructure within 30 calendar 
days after the completion and acceptance of the Traffic Signal Infrastructure by the City and the 
receipt of a written invoice from the City setting forth the total applicable costs.  Actual costs the 
District agrees to reimburse to the City include, but are not limited to, costs associated with the 
construction of the Traffic Signal Infrastructure, including such consultant and engineer fees as 



1346961.4 

3 

may be necessary, and those costs described in subsection (B), below.  The anticipated 
breakdown of the project costs is more particularly set forth in Exhibit C. 

 
B. It is understood by the parties that any and all costs for plan review 

and permits, if required, shall be paid by the District.  Construction as-built documentation, if 
requested, shall be paid for by the District.  The District agrees to make direct payment for the 
items set forth in Section 1.4(A) and (B) within 30 calendar days from the date the invoice is 
received by the District.  

 
2. Ownership; Maintenance.  Upon satisfactory completion and acceptance of the 

Traffic Signal Infrastructure, the City shall own the Traffic Signal Infrastructure, excluding any 
traffic control striping located outside the City’s right-of-way.  With the exception of any traffic 
control striping located outside the City’s right-of-way, the City shall be solely responsible for 
all required maintenance and repairs to the Traffic Signal Infrastructure as well as all costs 
associated with such maintenance and repairs.  The District shall be responsible for maintenance 
of all traffic control striping placed upon or along North High School Drive, as inidicated on the 
Vicinity Map attached hereto as Exhibit A. 

 
3. Indemnification.  To the extent permitted by law each Party shall defend, 

indemnify and hold harmless the other Party and its departments, officers, employees and 
agents from all losses, damages, claims, liabilities and expenses (including reasonable 
attorneys’ fees) for damages to property or for injury to or death of persons which relate to 
the performance of this Agreement and which result from any act, omission or negligence of 
the indemnifying Party or its departments, officers, employees or agents. 

 
4. Insurance.  The parties agree to secure and maintain insurance coverage for any 

and all risks that may arise out of the terms, obligations, operations and actions as set forth in 
this Agreement, including but not limited to public entity insurance.  The acquisition of 
insurance or the maintenance and operation of a self insurance program may fulfill the insurance 
requirement. 

 
5. Term and Payment.  The term of this Agreement shall be effective until the earlier 

to occur of: (i) completion of Traffic Signal Infrastructure, including (A) completion and 
acceptance of the Traffic Signal Infrastructure by the City, (B) receipt by the District of an 
invoice showing, among other things, the total costs of the Traffic Signal Infrastructure, and (C) 
reimbursement by District to the City for the amounts set forth in Section 1.4 above; (ii) sooner 
termination in accordance with Sections 6 or 16 below; or (iii) by mutual written consent of the 
Parties. 

 
6. Termination. 

 
6.1 Default.  In addition to any lawfully available remedies for breach of this 

Agreement, this Agreement may be terminated by either Party for material breach 30 days after 
written notice is given to the defaulting Party specifying the cause of the breach if such default is 
either not cured within said 30-day period or the cure thereof is not commenced within such 30 



1346961.4 

4 

day period and thereafter continuously and diligently pursued to conclusion.  In no event shall 
such cure period extend longer than 90 days. 

 
6.2 Expiration.  This Agreement shall automatically terminate if the City has 

failed to substantially complete the construction within 180 days from execution of this 
Agreement by all Parties. 

 
7. Independent Contractor.  The City and the District acknowledge and agree that, in 

providing the services under this Agreement, the City shall be considered an independent 
contractor, not an employee or agent of the District.  City, its employees, and subcontractors are 
not entitled to worker’s compensation benefits from the District.  The District does not have the 
authority to supervise or control the actual work of City, its employees or subcontractors.  The 
City, and not the District, shall determine the time of its performance of the services provided 
under this Agreement so long as City meets the requirements of its agreed scope of work as set 
forth in Section 1 above.  District and City do not intend to nor will they combine business 
operations under this Agreement. 

 
8. Relationship of the Parties.  Each party to this Agreement shall act in its 

individual capacity and not as an agent, employee, partner, joint venturer, associate, or any other 
representative capacity of the other.  Each party shall be solely and entirely responsible for its 
acts or acts of its agents and employees during the performance of this Agreement. 

 
9. Amendment.  This Agreement may be modified only by a written amendment 

approved by the parties’ respective governing bodies and signed by persons duly authorized to 
enter into contracts on behalf of the City and the District.  Any attempt at oral modification of 
this Agreement shall be void and of no effect.  

 
10. Records.  Both parties shall maintain the records required in this Agreement for a 

period of two years after the termination of this Agreement. 
 

11. Notices and Requests.  Any notice or other communication required or permitted 
to be given under this Agreement shall be in writing and shall be deemed to have been duly 
given if (i) delivered to the party at the address set forth below, (ii) deposited in the U.S. Mail, 
registered or certified, return receipt requested, to the address set forth below, (iii) given to a 
recognized and reputable overnight delivery service, to the address set forth below or (iv) 
delivered by facsimile transmission to the number set forth below: 

 

If to the City:  City of Avondale 
11465 West Civic Center Drive 
Avondale, Arizona 85323 
Attn:  Charles P. McClendon, City Manager 
Facsimile:  (623) 333-0100 



1346961.4 

5 

 

With copy to:   GUST ROSENFELD P.L.C. 
One East Washington Street, Suite 1600 
Phoenix Arizona  85004-2553 
Attn:  Andrew J. McGuire, Esq. 
Facsimile:  (602) 254-4878 

 
If to the District: Tolleson Union High School District 

9801 West Van Buren Street 
Tolleson, Arizona  85353 
Attn:  Dr. Margo Olivares-Seck, Interim Superintendent 
Facsimile:  (623) 478-4197 

 
With copy to:  LASOTA & PETERS, PLC 

722 East Osborn, Suite 100 
Phoenix, Arizona  85014 
Attn:  Don Peters, Esq. 
Facsimile:  (602) 248-2999 
 

 
or at such other address, and to the attention of such other person or officer, as any party may 
designate in writing by notice duly given pursuant to this Section.  Notices shall be deemed 
received (i) when delivered to the party, (ii) three business days after being placed in the U.S. 
Mail, properly addressed, with sufficient postage, (iii) the following business day after being 
given to a recognized overnight delivery service, with the person giving the notice paying all 
required charges and instructing the delivery service to deliver on the following business day, or 
(iv) when received by facsimile transmission or e-mail during the normal business hours of the 
recipient, with proof of delivery.  If a copy of a notice is also given to a party’s counsel or other 
recipient, the provisions above governing the date on which a notice is deemed to have been 
received by a party shall mean and refer to the date on which the party, and not its counsel or 
other recipient to which a copy of the notice may be sent, is deemed to have received the notice.   

 
12. Severability and Savings.  If any part of this Agreement is held to be invalid or 

unenforceable, such holding will not affect the validity or enforceability of any other part of this 
Agreement so long as the remainder of the Agreement is reasonably capable of completion 
without inequity to the parties. 
  

13. Program Continuation Subject to Appropriation.  The provisions of this 
Agreement for payment of funds by either Party shall be effective when funds are appropriated 
for purposes of this Agreement and are actually available for payment.  Each Party shall be the 
sole judge and authority in determining the availability of funds under this Agreement and each 
Party shall keep the other Party fully informed as to the availability of funds.  The obligation of 
either Party to make any payment pursuant to this Agreement is a current expense of each Party, 
payable exclusively from such annual appropriations, and is not a general obligation or 
indebtedness of either Party.  If the either Party fails to appropriate money sufficient to pay the 
reimbursements as set forth in this Agreement during any immediately succeeding fiscal year, 



1346961.4 

6 

this Agreement shall terminate at the end of then-current fiscal year and each Party shall be 
relieved of any subsequent obligation under this Agreement. 

 
14. Entire Agreement.  This Agreement comprises the entire agreement of the Parties 

and supersedes any and all other agreements or understandings, oral and written, whether 
previous to the execution hereof or contemporaneous herewith.  Any amendments or 
modifications to this Agreement shall be made only in writing and signed by the Parties to this 
Agreement. 

 
15. Applicable Law.  This Agreement shall be governed by and construed in 

accordance with the laws of the State of Arizona. 
 
16. Cancellation.   The parties hereto acknowledge that this Agreement is subject to 

cancellation pursuant to ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 38-511. 
 
17. Compliance with Non-Discrimination Laws.  The Parties hereto shall comply 

with Title VII of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 as amended, the Age Discrimination Employment 
Act, and State Executive Order No. 75-5 which mandates that all persons, regardless of race, 
color, religion, sex, age, national origin or political affiliation, shall have equal access to 
employment opportunities.  The Parties hereto shall comply with the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, 
as amended, which prohibits discrimination in the employment or advancement in employment 
of qualified persons because of physical or mental handicap, and the Americans with Disabilities 
Act. 

 
18. Disposition of Property upon Termination.  The Parties do not anticipate having 

to dispose of any property upon partial or complete termination of this Agreement.  However, to 
the extent that such disposition is necessary, property shall be returned to its original owner. 

 
19. Approvals.  With respect to any provision of this Agreement requiring the consent 

or approval of either Party as to any matter, unless specifically provided to the contrary in the 
particular provision requiring such consent or approval, that consent or approval shall not be 
unreasonably withheld, conditioned or delayed by the Party whose consent or approval is 
required. 

 
20. Waiver.  The waiver of any breach of this Agreement shall not be deemed to 

amend this Agreement and shall not constitute a waiver of any other subsequent breach. 
 
21. Headings.  Headings of this Agreement are for convenience only and shall not 

affect the interpretation of this Agreement. 
 
22. Sudan/Iran.  Pursuant to ARIZ. REV. STAT. §§ 35-391, et seq. and 35-393.06, et 

seq., the parties hereby warrant, and represent to each other that the parties and the parties’ 
subcontractors do not have, and will not have a scrutinized business operation in either Sudan or 
Iran during the term of this Agreement.  

 



1346961.4 

7 

23. E-Verify.  To the extent applicable under ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 41-4401, the parties 
warrant compliance, on behalf of themselves and any and all subcontractors, with all federal 
immigration laws and regulation that relate to their employees and compliance with the E-Verify 
requirements under ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 23-214(A).  The party’s breach of the above-mentioned 
warranty shall be deemed a material breach of this Agreement and the non-breaching party may 
terminate this Agreement.  The parties retain the legal right to inspect the papers of the other 
party to ensure that the party is complying with the above-mentioned warranty under this 
Agreement. 

 
24. Time of Essence.  Time is of the essence with respect to the performance of each 

and every term, condition, and obligation of this Agreement. 
 
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the City and the District have executed this Agreement as of 

the date of the last signature set forth below. 
 
“City”       “District” 
  
CITY OF AVONDALE, an Arizona   TOLLESON UNION HIGH SCHOOL  
municipal corporation     DISTRICT NO. 214, an Arizona school 
      district 
 
 
      By:      
Marie Lopez Rogers, Mayor            
 
ATTEST:       Name:       
 
 
       Its:       
Carmen Martinez, City Clerk  

 
In accordance with the requirements of ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 11-952(D), the undersigned City 
Attorneys acknowledge that (i) they have reviewed the above agreement on behalf of their 
respective clients and (ii) as to their respective clients only, each attorney has determined that 
this Agreement is in proper form and is within the powers and authority granted under the laws 
of the State of Arizona. 
 
 
 
              
Andrew J. McGuire         
Avondale City Attorney    Attorney for Tolleson Union High School  

District No. 214 
 

 



 

1346961.4 

EXHIBIT A 
TO 

INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT 
BETWEEN 

TOLLESON UNION HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 214 
AND 

THE CITY OF AVONDALE 
 

[Vicinity Map]  
 

See following pages. 
 





 

1346961.4 

EXHIBIT B 
TO 

INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT 
BETWEEN 

TOLLESON UNION HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 214 
AND 

THE CITY OF AVONDALE 
 

[Temporary Construction Easement]  
 

See following pages. 



1351590.1 

When Recorded Mail To: 
 
City Clerk 
City of Avondale 
11465 West Civic Center Drive, Suite 200 
Avondale, Arizona  85323 

 

 
TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION 

EASEMENT AGREEMENT 

 
GRANTOR: Tolleson Union High School District #214 of Maricopa County, a political 

subdivision of the State of Arizona 
 

GRANTEE: City of Avondale, an Arizona municipal corporation (the “City”) 
 

THIS TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT AGREEMENT (this 
“Agreement”) is entered into     , 2010, by and between the City and the 
Grantor for the purposes set forth below. 
 

RECITALS 
 

A. Grantor is the record owner of certain real property at the location described and 
depicted on Exhibit 1, attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference (the “Property”). 
 

B. The City has requested, and Grantor has agreed to grant to the City, a non-
exclusive Temporary Construction Easement (the “Easement”) upon, over, across, in, through 
and under the Property for the purpose of traffic signal facility and roadway improvement 
construction and all appurtenances related thereto. 

 
AGREEMENT 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the recitals set forth above, which are 

incorporated herein by reference, the mutual covenants set forth herein and other valuable 
consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which is hereby acknowledged, Grantor and the City 
agree as follows: 

 
1. Grant of Easement.  Grantor hereby grants to the City the Easement upon, over, 

across, in, through and under the Property for the purposes of traffic signal facility and roadway 
improvement construction and all appurtenances related thereto and all appurtenances related 
thereto. 

 
2. Indemnification.  The City covenants and agrees with Grantor, on behalf of itself 

or its successors and assigns, as the case may be, to indemnify, defend and to hold harmless 
Grantor, its successors and assigns, for, from and against any and all claims, liabilities and 
expenses which may be claimed or asserted against Grantor, its successors or assigns, or the 
Property, arising from the exercise by the City of the rights and easements herein granted and 
conveyed, including, but without limitation, injury to any person or property, any mechanics’ or 



1351590.1 

2 

materialmen’s liens or claims of lien which may be asserted against Grantor as a result of the 
City’s exercise of the rights set forth herein. 

 
3. Consideration.  Grantor agrees to furnish the Easement at no additional 

consideration to the City.  This Agreement shall remain in effect until June 30, 2011, unless 
extended by mutual agreement of the parties hereto. 
 

4. Reservation of Rights.  Grantor hereby reserves all such rights and privileges in 
the Property as may be used and enjoyed by Grantor without interfering with or abridging the 
rights conveyed to the City. 

 
5. Running of Benefits and Burdens.  The provisions of this Agreement, including 

the benefits and burdens, run with the land and are binding upon and inure to the assigns and 
successors and tenants of the parties hereto. 

 
6. Counterparts.  This Agreement may be executed in counterparts, all of which are 

identical, each of which shall be deemed an original, and all of which counterparts, when 
executed, taken together shall constitute one and the same instrument. 

 
7. Cancellation by Parties.  This Agreement may be cancelled by the parties pursuant to 

ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 38-511. 
 
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this instrument as of the date 

and year first set forth above. 
 

ACCEPTED BY: 
 
“City” 
 
CITY OF AVONDALE, an Arizona 
municipal corporation 
 
 
 
By:  

Charles P. McClendon, City Manager 
 

 
 
“Grantor” 
 
TOLLESON UNION HIGH SCHOOL 
DISTRICT #214 OF MARICOPA COUNTY, a 
political subdivision of the State of Arizona 
 
 
 
By:       
 
Name:       
 
Its:       
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
       
Dr. Margo Seck, Interim Superintendent 

 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
  
Carmen Martinez, City Clerk 

 



1351590.1 

3 

(ACKNOWLEDGMENTS) 
 
STATE OF ARIZONA ) 
    ) ss. 
COUNTY OF MARICOPA ) 

 
This instrument was acknowledged before me on      , 2010, 

by     , the      of TOLLESON UNION HIGH 
SCHOOL DISTRICT #214 OF MARICOPA COUNTY, a political subdivision of the State of 
Arizona, on behalf of the district. 

 
 
       
Notary Public in and for the State of Arizona 

 
My Commission Expires: 
 
 
     
 
 
STATE OF ARIZONA ) 
    ) ss. 
COUNTY OF MARICOPA ) 
 

This instrument was acknowledged before me on      , 2010, 
by Charles P. McClendon, as City Manager of the CITY OF AVONDALE, an Arizona 
municipal corporation on behalf of the corporation. 

 
 
       
Notary Public in and for the State of Arizona 

 
My Commission Expires: 
 
 
     
 
 



1351590.1 

EXHIBIT 1 
TO 

TEMPORARY CONSTRUCTION 
EASEMENT AGREEMENT 

 
[Map of Temporary Construction Easement] 

 
See following pages. 





 

1346961.4 

EXHIBIT C 
TO 

INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT 
BETWEEN 

TOLLESON UNION HIGH SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 214 
AND 

THE CITY OF AVONDALE 
 

[Preliminary Cost Estimate]  
 

See following pages. 
 
 



November 1, 2010

Units Quantity Unit cost Cost

Remove Existing Sidewalk SF 130 2.50$               325.00$                  

Install Sidewalk per MAG STD DTL 230 SF 45 5.00$               225.00$                  

Install Mid-Block Ramp per City of Avondale DTL A1237-1 EA 1 1,250.00$        1,250.00$               

Traffic Signal and Appurtenances* EA 1 224,735.00$    224,735.00$           

Signing and Striping on School Property and Fry's Driveway LS 1 2,500.00$        2,500.00$               

Bollards with Sign LS 1 1,000.00$        1,000.00$               

Grand Total 230,035.00$       

Notes:

* - Please see the attached cost estimate by Wright Engineering for details.

WESTVIEW HIGH SCHOOL

for Work Under School District Obligation

Description

Engineer's Estimate of Probable Construction Costs 

TRAFFIC SIGNAL IMPROVEMENTS

HW Project No. 1034

U:\1000\1034\Cost Estimates\1034 Preliminary Cost Estimate 1 of 1



CITY OF AVONDALE

WESTVIEW HIGH SCHOOL

107TH AVE AND WESTVIEW DRIVEWAY

TRAFFIC SIGNAL IMPROVEMENTS

COST ESTIMATE 

7TH OCTOBER 2010

UNIT TOTAL

NO. DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE

1 TYPE 'G' POLE 1 EACH $2,500.00 $2,500.00

2 TRAFFIC SIGNAL 'Q' POLE 2 EACH $6,400.00 $12,800.00

3 TRAFFIC SIGNAL 'R' POLE 1 EACH $7,900.00 $7,900.00

4 LUMINAIRE MAST ARM WITH 155W LED LUMINAIRE 4 EACH $1,500.00 $6,000.00

5 TRAFFIC SIGNAL FOUNDATION FOR TYPE J, K, 

Q, OR R POLE 3 EACH $4,000.00 $12,000.00

6 TRAFFIC SIGNAL FOUNDATION FOR TYPE G POLE 1 EACH $2,500.00 $2,500.00

7 30' SIGNAL MAST ARM 1 C $ $2 500 00

QUANTITY

 165 EAST CHILTON - CHANDLER, ARIZONA 85225      OFFICE: 480/497-5829   FAX: 480/497-5807

www.wrightengr.com

7 30' SIGNAL MAST ARM 1 EACH $2,500.00 $2,500.00

8 35' SIGNAL MAST ARM 1 EACH $4,000.00 $4,000.00

9 45' SIGNAL MAST ARM 1 EACH $6,300.00 $6,300.00

10 TYPE 'F' SIGNAL HEAD 8 EACH $600.00 $4,800.00

11 TYPE 'Q' SIGNAL HEAD 2 EACH $900.00 $1,800.00

12 PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL HEAD 6 EACH $825.00 $4,950.00

13 VIDEO DETECTION CAMERA WITH ALL 

MOUNTING HARDWARE 4 EACH $7,000.00 $28,000.00

14 TRAFFIC SIGNAL CONTROLLER CABINET WITH 

ALL CONTROL MODULES 1 EACH $27,000.00 $27,000.00

15 PEDESTAL MOUNTED METERED SERVICE 

ENCLOSURE 1 EACH $7,600.00 $7,600.00

 165 EAST CHILTON - CHANDLER, ARIZONA 85225      OFFICE: 480/497-5829   FAX: 480/497-5807

www.wrightengr.com



16 EMERGENCY PRE-EMPTION SENSOR 2 EACH $1,000.00 $2,000.00

17 EMERGENCY PRE-EMPTION WIRE & CARD 1 EACH $3,000.00 $3,000.00

18 INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED STREET NAME SIGN 3 EACH $4,000.00 $12,000.00

19 PEDESTRIAN PUSH BUTTON 4 EACH $250.00 $1,000.00

20 TYPE II HEAD MOUNTING 7 EACH $150.00 $1,050.00

21 TYPE V HEAD MOUNTING 5 EACH $325.00 $1,625.00

22 TYPE VII HEAD MOUNTING 1 EACH $350.00 $350.00

23 #7 TRAFFIC SIGNAL PULL BOX WITH EXTENSION 4 EACH $600.00 $2,400.00

24 2" SCH 40 PVC CONDUIT FOR TRAFFIC SIGNAL 20 L.F. $16.00 $320.00

25 4" SCH 40 PVC CONDUIT FOR TRAFFIC SIGNAL 730 L.F. $18.00 $13,140.00

26 TRAFFIC SIGNAL CONDUCTORS AND CABLES 1 LUMP SUM $18,000.00 $18,000.00

27 #7 TRAFFIC SIGNAL PULL BOX WITH EXTENSION 

FOR TRAFFIC SIGNAL INTERCONNECT 3 EACH $600.00 $1,800.00

 165 EAST CHILTON - CHANDLER, ARIZONA 85225      OFFICE: 480/497-5829   FAX: 480/497-5807

www.wrightengr.com

28 FIBER SPLICE VAULT 2 EACH $1,200.00 $2,400.00

29 (2) 3" SCH 80 PVC CONDUIT AND TRENCH FOR 

TRAFFIC SIGNAL INTERCONNECT 1500 L.F. $18.00 $27,000.00

30 96 STRAND SMFO AND 2500 LB MULE TAPE 1500 L.F. $5.00 $7,500.00

31 FIBER SPLICING, INCLUDING SPLICE RACKS, 

ENCLOSURES, TESTING, ETC. 1 LUM SUM $3,000.00 $3,000.00

TOTAL $224,735.00

 165 EAST CHILTON - CHANDLER, ARIZONA 85225      OFFICE: 480/497-5829   FAX: 480/497-5807

www.wrightengr.com





CITY COUNCIL REPORT

SUBJECT: 
Appointment of Members to the City's Boards, 

Commission and Committees and to the positions 

of Chair and Vice Chair of the Planning 

Commission 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

 
 

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Carmen Martinez, City Clerk (623) 333-1214

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager

PURPOSE:

City Council will consider the Council Subcommittee's recommendations for appointment to the City's 
Boards, Commissions and Committees and the appointment of two members to serve as Chair and 
Vice Chair of the Planning Commission. 

DISCUSSION:

The Council Subcommittee hosted a Meet and Greet with candidates for appointment on Thursday, 
November 18, 2010. Their recommendations for appointment are as follows: 
 

 

 

 

 
 
 

Avondale Municipal Art Committee

Janet Ellis (Alternate) 12/31/13

Stephanie Franklin 12/31/13 

Bryan Kilgore 12/31/13

Maureen Lambright 12/31/13

Carin Vierhout 12/31/13

Board of Adjusment

Darin Mitchell (Alternate) 12/31/13

Joseph Mosca 12/31/13

David Sours 12/31/13

CIP - Zone 1

Bryan Kilgore 12/31/13

Citizen Corps Council

Gena Byrd 12/31/13

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
Section 15.4 of the Council Rules of Procedure outline minimum qualifications for appointment. 
Section 15.4-A-2 states that candidates must be residents of Avondale for a least one year but 
allows the Council to waive this requirement at their discretion. Ms Janet Ellis was a resident of 
Avondale from 2005 to 2008; moved away in mid 2008 and returned to Avondale in June 2010. Ms 
Ellis is interested in being appointed to the Municipal Art Committee and has requested a waiver of 
the one-year residency requirement. The sucommittee is recommending the appointment of Ms Ellis 
as an alternate member of the Municipal Art Committee thereby granting a waiver of the residency 
requirement.  
 
In addition, the Council Subcommittee is recommending appointment of Mr. Michael Long as Chair 
and Ms Angela Cotera as Vice Chair of the Planning Commission.  
 
 
 
 

Environmental Affairs Commission

Gena Byrd 12/31/12 

Stephanie Franklin 12/31/13

Nadine Johnson 12/31/13

Joseph Mosca 12/31/13

Gustavo Rodriguez (Youth Member) 12/31/13

William Williams 12/31/13

Library Advisory Board

Maureen Lambright 12/31/13

Municipal Development Corporation 

Darin Mitchell Indefinite

Neighborhood and Family Service Commission

Rosalie Baldonado 12/31/13 

Grace Carrillo 12/31/13

Debora Polisky (Alternate) 12/31/13

Parks and Recreation Advisory Board 

Rick Spencer 12/31/13 

Planning Commission

Angela Cotera 12/31/13

Risk Management Trust Fund Board

Betty Lynch 12/31/13



RECOMMENDATION:

The Council Subcommittee is recommending appointment of members of the City's Boards, 
Commissions and Committees as outlined above and appointment of Mr. Michael Long as Chair and 
Ms Angela Cotera as Vice Chair of the Planning Commission. 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

No Attachments Available 



CITY COUNCIL REPORT

SUBJECT: 
Public Hearing - Ordinance - Use of Fireworks 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

 
 

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Paul Adams, Fire Chief (623) 333-6100

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager

PURPOSE:

Staff is requesting that the Mayor and City Council consider the adoption of an Ordinance prohibiting 
the use of fireworks, with the exception of novelty items, within the corporate limits of the City of 
Avondale. 

BACKGROUND:

To this point the sale and use of fireworks, with the exception of federally deregulated novelty items, 
have been illegal in the State of Arizona. However, in the last legislative session HB-2246, which 
would allow the sale and use of certain consumer fireworks, was approved by the legislature and 
signed into law by the Governor. The law becomes effective on December 1, 2010 and prohibits 
local jurisdictions from taking any action that would interfere with the sale of consumer fireworks but 
does allow cities and towns to restrict the use of fireworks within their jurisdiction. 
 
Staff presented information concerning the impact of the new law at a Council Work Session on 
October 11. At that time staff received direction to develop an ordinance for the Council to consider 
that would ban the use of fireworks within the City. 

DISCUSSION:

HB-2246 allows the sale and use of state-approved, non-aerial consumer fireworks as defined by the 
2001 version of the American Pyrotechnics Association Standard 87-1. The bill continues to prohibit 
the sale or use of firecrackers, items that report and aerial fireworks except by a qualified pyrotechnic 
expert (as defined by the local governing body). The sale of fireworks is limited to persons 16 years 
of age and older. 
 
With respect to local ordinances HB-2246 states that "the regulation of permissible consumer 
fireworks pursuant to this article and their use is not subject to further regulation by a governing 
body, except that an incorporated city or town may regulate the use of permissible consumer 
fireworks within its corporate limits ..." so Avondale would be able to regulate the use of fireworks but 
can in no way restrict the sale of permitted consumer fireworks within our city limits other than the 
restrictions permitted by the 2006 edition of NFPA 1124 which is required to be adopted by the State 
through the State Fire Marshal's office. 
 
There is no doubt that fireworks can be dangerous if not handled properly. A sparkler, for example, 
can burn at a temperature in excess of 1200 degrees which will easily ignite clothing and most other 
natural products (paper, wood, etc.) The use of fireworks certainly presents the city with the potential 
for a number of negative impacts including fireworks related fires, injuries, vandalism, crime related 
to fireworks stands and potential noise complaints. Fireworks related incidents accounted for an 
estimated 22,500 fires, 40 injuries, 1 death and $42 million in property damage nationally in 2008 
according to the National Fire Protection Association (NFPA). 

 



 
Staff is presenting an Ordinance for consideration that would prohibit the use of fireworks, other than 
federally deregulated novelty items, within the corporate limits of the City. The ordinance would 
further prohibit the sale of fireworks to persons under the age of 16 and require signage at the point 
of sale clearly indicating that the use of fireworks within the city is prohibited. 
 
The ordinance also includes a liability clause relating to the emergency response expenses incurred 
due to the use of fireworks within the city, establishes a civil fine and establishes enforcement 
authority. 
 
While most valley cities are considering adopting a similar ordinance to date only Goodyear, Tempe, 
Fountain Hills and Cave Creek have formally taken action to ban fireworks. 

BUDGETARY IMPACT:

There is no budgetary impact associated with this item except that enforcement will require staff 
time, primarily from Police Officers. 

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends that the Mayor and City Council adopt an Ordinance prohibiting the use of 
fireworks, with the exception of novelty items, within the corporate limits of the City of Avondale. 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

Ordinance 1432-1210



1367984.1 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ORDINANCE NO. 1432-1210 

 
AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AVONDALE, 
ARIZONA, AMENDING THE AVONDALE CITY CODE, CHAPTER 10, FIRE 
PREVENTION AND PROTECTION, RELATING TO THE USE OF 
FIREWORKS. 
 
WHEREAS, the Council of the City of Avondale (the “City Council”) deem it necessary 

to adopt certain regulations to protect, enhance and promote the health, safety and welfare of the 
City of Avondale (the “City”) and its residents; and 

 
WHEREAS, the City Council desires to prevent fire hazards that threaten the safety of 

individuals and private and public improvements, including residential, commercial and 
industrial dwellings; and 

 
WHEREAS, due to the dry/desert conditions existing adjacent to or within the City, the 

ever-present risk of wildfires and the challenging terrain which the dry/desert conditions exist, 
the danger of fire associated with the use of consumer fireworks is enhanced, causing the 
possibility of serious fire damage to the community and injury to its residents; and 

 
WHEREAS, the City Council desires to reduce the threat of harm to the community by 

banning the use of fireworks within its corporate limits. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

AVONDALE as follows: 
 
SECTION 1.  The foregoing recitals are incorporated as if fully set forth herein. 
 
SECTION 2.  The Avondale City Code, Chapter 10, Fire Prevention and Protection, is 

hereby amended by creating a new Article IV, Fireworks, to read as follows: 
 

Article IV – Fireworks. 

 
Section 10-44 - Definitions.  The following words, terms and phrases, when used in this Article, 
have the meanings ascribed to them in this Article, except where the context clearly indicates a 
different meaning: 

 
“Consumer Firework” means those fireworks defined as such by ARIZ. REV. STAT. 

§ 36-1601, as amended. 
 



 

1367984.1 
2 

“Display Firework” means those fireworks defined as such by ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 36-
1601, as amended. 

 
“Expenses of an Emergency Response” means Reasonable Costs directly incurred by 

public agencies, for-profit entities or not-for-profit entities that make an appropriate emergency 
response to an incident. 

 
“Fireworks” means any combustible or explosive composition, substance or 

combination of substances, or any article prepared for the purpose of producing a visible or 
audible effect by combustion, explosion, deflagration or detonation, including a Consumer 
Firework, Display Firework or permissible consumer firework as defined by ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 
36-1601, as amended. 

 
“Novelty Items” means federally deregulated novelty items that are known as snappers, 

snap caps, party poppers, glow worms, snakes, toy smoke devices, sparklers, and certain toys 
excluded from the definition of Fireworks, as Fireworks is defined in ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 36-
1601, as amended. 

 
“Permissible Consumer Fireworks” means those Fireworks defined as such by ARIZ. 

REV. STAT. § 36-1601, as amended, that may be sold within the City, even where the use of those 
items has been prohibited. 

 
“Reasonable Costs” includes the costs of providing police, fire fighting, rescue and 

emergency medical services at the scene of an incident and the salaries of the persons who 
respond to the incident. 

 
“Supervised Public Display” means a monitored performance of Display Fireworks 

open to the public and authorized by permit by the Fire Chief or authorized designee. 
 

Section 10-45 - Use of Fireworks prohibited; exceptions. 

 
(a) The use, discharge or ignition of Fireworks within the corporate limits of the City 

is prohibited. 
 

(b) Nothing in this Section 10-45 on in this Article shall be construed to prohibit the 
use, discharge or ignition of Novelty Items or the occurrence of a Supervised Public Display of 
Fireworks.  

 
(c) Permits may be granted by the Fire Chief or authorized designee for conducting a 

properly Supervised Public Display of Fireworks.  Every such Supervised Public Display of 
Fireworks shall be of such character and so located, discharged or fired, only after proper 
inspection and in a manner that does not endanger persons, animals or property.  A permit shall 
not be issued, and may be revoked, during time periods of High Fire Danger warnings as 
declared by the United States National Weather Service.  The Fire Chief or authorized designee 
has authority to impose conditions on any permits granted. 

 



 

1367984.1 
3 

(d) Failure to comply with any permit requirements issued by the Fire Chief or 
authorized designee is a civil offense punishable by a base civil fine of up to Seven Hundred and 
Fifty Dollars ($750) for each violation.  
 
Section 10-46 - Sale of Fireworks. 

 
(a) No person shall sell, permit or authorize the sale of Permissible Consumer 

Fireworks to a person who is under sixteen (16) years of age. 
 
(b) No person shall sell, permit or authorize the sale of Permissible Consumer 

Fireworks in conflict with State law. 
 

Section 10-47 - Posting of signs by persons engaged in the sale of Fireworks; civil penalty. 

 
(a) Prior to the sale of Permissible Consumer Fireworks, every person engaged in 

such sales shall prominently display signs indicating the following: 
 

(1) The use of Fireworks, including Permissible Consumer Fireworks except 
Novelty Items is prohibited within the corporate limits of the City. 

 
(2) Consumer Fireworks authorized for sale under State law may not be sold 

to persons under the age of sixteen (16). 
 
(b) Signs required under this Section 10-47 shall be placed at each cash register and 

in each area where Fireworks are displayed for sale. 
 
(c) The Fire Chief or authorized designee shall develop regulations concerning the 

size and color of the required signs and shall develop a model sign.  The required sign 
regulations and model sign shall be posted on the City’s website and filed with the City Clerk’s 
office. 

 
(d) Failure to comply with Subsections (a) or (b) of this Section 10-47 is a civil 

offense punishable by a base civil fine of up to Seven Hundred and Fifty Dollars ($750) for each 
violation. 

 
Section 10-48 - Authority to enforce violations of this Article; means of enforcement.  

 
(a) The Fire Chief or authorized designee, a City Police Officer, a City Code 

Enforcement Officer or the City Prosecutor may issue civil complaints to enforce violations of 
this Article designated as civil offenses. 

 
(b) Any person authorized pursuant to this Section 10-48 to issue a civil complaint 

may also issue a notice of violation specifying actions to be taken and the time in which they are 
to be taken to avoid issuance of a civil or criminal complaint. 

 
(c) A City Police Officer or the City Prosecutor may issue criminal complaints to 

enforce this Article. 



 

1367984.1 
4 

 
Section 10-49 - Liability for emergency responses related to use of Fireworks. 

 
(a) A person who uses, discharges or ignites Permissible Consumer Fireworks, 

Fireworks or anything that is designed or intended to rise into the air and explode or to detonate 
in the air or to fly above the ground, is liable for the Expenses of any Emergency Response that 
is required by such use, discharge or ignition.  The fact that a person is convicted or found 
responsible for a violation(s) of this Article is prima facie evidence of liability under this Section 
10-49. 

(b) The Expenses of an Emergency Response are a charge against the person liable 
for those expenses pursuant to Subsection (a) of this Section 10-49.  The charge constitutes a 
debt of that person and may be collected proportionately by the public agencies, for-profit 
entities or not-for-profit entities that incurred the expenses.  The liability imposed under this 
Section 10-49 is in addition to and not in limitation of any other liability that may be imposed. 
 

Section 10-50 - Penalty. 

 
Unless otherwise specifically set forth in this Article, the penalty for violating any 

prohibition or requirement imposed by this Article is a class three misdemeanor. 
 
SECTION 3.  The immediate operation of this Ordinance is necessary to ensure public 

health and safety; therefore, an emergency is hereby declared to exist.  This Ordinance shall be in 
full force and effect from and after its passage and approval by the City Council as required by 
law, and this Ordinance is hereby exempt from the referendum provisions of the constitution and 
laws of the State of Arizona. 

 
SECTION 4.  That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase or portion of this 

Ordinance is for any reason to be held invalid or unconstitutional by the decision of any court of 
competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions 
thereof. 

 
SECTION 5.  That the Mayor, the City Manager, the City Clerk and the City Attorney 

are hereby authorized and directed to take all steps and to execute all documents necessary to 
carry out the purpose and intent of this Ordinance. 

 
 

[SIGNATURES ON FOLLOWING PAGE] 



 

1367984.1 
5 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Council of the City of Avondale, December 6, 2010. 
 
 
 
       
Marie Lopez Rogers, Mayor 

 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
       
Carmen Martinez, City Clerk 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
 
       
Andrew J. McGuire, City Attorney 



DEVELOPMENT 
SERVICES

SUBJECT: 
Master and Final Site Plan Approval Extension - 

Avondale Phoenix Children’s Hospital 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

  

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Sue McDermott, Development Services and Engineering Department Director, (623) 
333-4211

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager (623) 333-1015

REQUEST: Extend the approval of the Phoenix Children's Hospital Master and Final Site Plans 
for one year from the date of expiration, until October 20, 2011. 

PARCEL 

SIZE:

Approximately 12.6 Acres

LOCATION: Northeast corner of Avondale Boulevard and McDowell Road (Exhibits A and B) 

APPLICANT: Mr. Ivan Hilton, Ensemble Devman of Arizona (602) 385-2850

OWNER: Phoenix Children’s Hospital

BACKGROUND:

On October 20, 2008, the City Council approved the Site Plan (Exhibit D) for the first Phoenix 
Children's Hospital, a Planned Area Development (PAD) located at the northeast corner of Avondale 
Boulevard and McDowell Road. A landscape plan (Exhibit E), preliminary grading & drainage plan, 
photometric plan, building elevations, materials & colors board, and comprehensive sign plan were 
included as part of the Site Plan approval. 
 
The approved Site Plan proposed building the project in three phases, as follows:  
 

n Phase I includes a one-story, 15' tall building which will function as a pediatric medical clinic 
and urgent care facility. The clinic building is approximately 36,000 square feet in area. The 
square footage devoted to clinical uses will be reduced to roughly 18,000 feet upon completion 
of Phase III, with approximately 18,000 square feet being converted into Emergency Room 
facilities when the Hospital is completed.  

n Phase II is a two-story 30' tall medical office building (MOB) measured to the roof deck. With 
parapet and mechanical equipment screening walls, the highest point of the building will be 42' 
above grade. The medical office building will be roughly 36,000 square feet in area and 
construction is expected to begin on Phase II shortly after the clinic phase of the project 
commences.  

n Phase III is a two-story, 30' tall hospital building measured to the roof deck. As with the MOB, 
the highest point of the building will extend to 42' above grade. The hospital will add an 
additional 96,000 square feet of floor area to the complex. When taking into account the 18,000 
square feet of clinic which will be converted to Emergency facilities, the total square footage of 
the hospital at build out will be approximately 114,000 square feet. The hospital phase of the 
project is not expected to commence in the near term.  

 



The approval was subject to 21 stipulations (Exhibit G), including a standard stipulation (Stipulation 
#2) which specified an expiration date for the site plan approval. The stipulation reads, “The plan 
approval expires in one year from date of approval unless a building permit has been issued.” The 
City Council approved a one-year extension for the site plan last year on December 14, 2009. An 
additional one-year extension is required to maintain the validity of the site plan through October 20, 
2011. 
 
Since the City Council approved the Site Plan in October 2008, the applicant submitted final 
construction documents and civil improvement plans relating to Phases I and II of the project. The 
plans for Phase I were approved on February 19, 2009; however, a building permit was never 
issued. The plans for Phase II have not been approved.  
 

Because a building permit was not issued by October 20th, a second extension is required to 
maintain the validity of the Phoenix Children's Hospital approvals.  
The applicant has cited (Exhibit C) several factors for why development of the property has been 
delayed. These factors include the overall general economic decline that has stunted growth both 
regionally and nationally as well as the need for Phoenix Children's Hospital to complete several 
outstanding projects in other cities before the Avondale project could commence. The applicant 
states that due to an improving economy and the completion of Phoenix Children's Hospital's other 
projects, construction of the Avondale site is expected to begin within the next year. The schedule 
included with the narrative indicates that permits will be picked up in March 2011, construction will 
commence in April 2011, and the first phase will be completed in December 2011. Kitchell Builders 
has been selected by PCH as the general contractor for the project. 

SUMMARY OF REQUEST:

The applicant has requested that the City Council grant a one-year extension for the Phoenix 
Children's Site Plan to allow additional time to secure required financing and commence 
construction. The request would be valid through October 20, 2011. 

PARTICIPATION:

Public notifications are not required for Site Plan Extensions. 

PLANNING COMMISSION ACTION:

The Planning Commission does not review Site Plan Extensions. 

ANALYSIS:

The approved Phoenix Children's Hospital PAD remains valid until October 20, 2011. Rather than 
referencing Zoning Ordinance sections for development and design standards, the approved PAD 
specifies customized standards for items such as landscaping and parking and includes conceptual 
plans (i.e. conceptual site plan, conceptual landscape plan) for the development of the site. As a 
result, the site plan remains in complete conformance with the approved PAD and the Zoning 
Ordinance, despite recent amendments to the Zoning Ordinance. Furthermore, the project remains 
vital to the economic growth of the City, specifically in regards to the McDowell Road corridor. For 
these reasons, staff supports granting a one year Site Plan extension. 

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends that the City Council approve a time extension for the Phoenix Children's Hospital 
Master and Final Site Plans until October 20, 2011. 

PROPOSED MOTION:

I move that the City Council GRANT a time extension for the Phoenix Children's Hospital Master and 
Final Site Plans until October 20, 2011.  
 
 



 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

Exhibit A - Zoning Vicinity Map

Exhibit B - Aerial Photograph

Exhibit C - Applicant’s Extension Request dated October 7, 2010

Exhibit D - Approved Phoenix Children’s Hospital Master Site Plan

Exhibit E - Approved Phoenix Children’s Hospital Landscape Plan

Exhibit F - Approved Phoenix Children’s Hospital Building Elevations 

Exhibit G - Phoenix Children’s Hospital Master and Final Site Plan approval letter, dated October 22, 2008

Exhibit H - Excerpt from City Council Minutes, Regular Meeting of October 20, 2008







 

 

Phoenix Children’s Hospital Avondale Clinic 

Site Plan Extension Narrative 

October 7, 2010 
 

 

 Location: 
o Nearest intersecting streets of the property.   

 Avondale Boulevard and McDowell Road 

o Size of property. 

 12.65 acres 

 

 History: 
o Date Annexed  

 April 20, 1987 

o Date Zoned  

 October 20, 2008 

o Subsequent actions with staff, the Planning commission, of City 

Council after Site Plan approval.  List all Dates.  Be sure to list all 

approvals. 

 October 20, 2008 – Master Site Plan was approved.  

 Application  DR-08-05 

 May 13, 2009 Extension requested and approved. 

 November 2, 2009 Extension requested and approved 

 

 Request: 
o Request is for a maximum one year extension. 

 Although we are expecting to begin construction much sooner, we 

are requesting a one year extension to the site plan approval.  

 

 Justification: 
o Why wasn’t the property developed within the one year allotment? 

 Several issues caused this project’s start date to be delayed. 

 The decline of the economy in general in 2008 was a major 

factor which created a change in the financing strategy for 

the project in general. 

 The economy also caused declines in reimbursement to 

Phoenix Children’s Hospital at the time which had a direct 

impact on this project.    

 With several major projects and opportunities happening at 

the same time at Phoenix Children’s Hospital the Avondale 

project had to be delayed until those projects and 

opportunities were either completed or resolved.  

EXHIBIT C



o Why will one more year make a difference? 

 The economy is improving and interest in the project in Avondale 

is increasing. 

 The major projects and issues for PCH either have been or will be 

resolved soon which will allow this project to proceed.  

 

o What step in the development process is the project in as of the date of 

this application? 

 The project is totally designed. 

 Kitchell Builders has been selected to be the general contractor.   

 The project is “shovel ready”.   

 Construction financing has yet to be secured however it is expected 

that once the decision is made to proceed the financing will follow 

quickly.  

 

o Provide a schedule that shows how construction will be underway 

within the time period granted by the extension.   

 A schedule is provided with this application showing the 

completion of the various steps in the process and those that are yet 

to be completed.   

 



ID Task Name Duration Finish Total
Slack

Predecessors Resource
Initials

0

PCH Avondale Clinic
975

days
Tue

1/3/12
0

days

1
1 PRELI MI NARY

RESPONSE PHASE

0 days Wed
3/5/08

376
days

2
2 CONCEPTUAL

DEVELOPMENT PHASE

118
days

Tue
8/19/08

0 days

39
3 APPROVAL PHASE 701

days
Thu

2/24/11
223

days

40 3.1 HOSPI TAL AGREEMENTS 644
days

Thu
2/10/11

19
days

41 3.1.1 Finalize & Sign Master

Agreement

600 days Fri 1/7/11 0 days 38,5 MM

42 3.1.2 Establish & prepare draft

legal descriptions

49 days Tue
9/30/08

0 days 54,23 DB

43 3.1.3 Order & review initial

title report

5 days Tue
7/29/08

0 days 23 SA

44 3.1.4 Review & Finalize legal

descriptions

5 days Tue
10/7/08

0 days 42,43SS DB

45 3.1.5 Revise the Draft Ground

Lease for the clinic

600 days Thu
2/10/11

19 days 44 IH

46 3.1.6 Draft REA 590 days Thu
2/10/11

19 days 44 MM

47 3.2 OWNERSHI P 608
days

Wed
1/19/11

45
days

48 3.2.1 UHT In Process Approval 5 days Tue
8/26/08

0 days 38 MM

49 3.2.2 Create Ownership Entity

& File DBA

10 days Wed
9/10/08

0 days 48 MM

50 3.2.3 Environmental

Investigation

15 days Wed
9/17/08

0 days 41 DB

51 3.2.4 Prepare Formal UHT

Approval Documents

10 days Mon
9/15/08

0 days 48,78 MM

52 3.2.5 Formal UHT Approval

(Quarterly Board Meetings)

590 days Wed
1/19/11

45 days 78,51 MM

53 3.3 PROJECT DESI GN 154
days

Wed
12/24/08

0 days

60 3.4 GENERAL CONTRACTOR BI D 27 days Thu
8/28/08

0 days

65 3.5 BUDGET 3 days Tue
9/9/08

0 days

Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e Mar
Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 201 Qtr 2, 201 Qtr 3, 201 Qtr 4, 201 Qtr 1, 201 Qtr 2, 201 Qtr 3, 201 Qtr 4, 201 Qtr 1, 201

Task

Critical Task

Progress

Milestone

Summary

Rolled Up Task

Rolled Up Critical Task

Rolled Up Milestone

Rolled Up Progress

Split

External Tasks

Project Summary

Group By Summary

Deadline

Page 1

Project: PCH Avondale Clinic
Date: Thu 10/7/10



ID Task Name Duration Finish Total
Slack

Predecessors Resource
Initials

68 3.6 PROJECT SCHEDULE 2 days Fri
8/29/08

0 days

70 3.7 GOVERNMENT ENTI TLEMENTS 59 days Mon
12/8/08

0 days

74 3.8 LEASI NG 634
days

Thu
2/24/11

223
days

75 3.8.1 Set Initial Rates 1 day Wed
8/20/08

0 days 38 MM

76 3.8.2 Set Final Rates 1 day Tue
9/9/08

0 days 78 MM

77 3.8.3 Prepare Lease Form 10 days Thu
2/24/11

223
days

45,49 MM

78 3.9 Verified

Development Analysis

0 days Mon
9/8/08

16 days 66,69 MM,IH

79
4 PRE-CONSTRUCTI ON

PHASE

705
days

Fri 4/1/11 197
days

80 4.1 HOSPI TAL AGREEMENTS 10 days Thu
2/24/11

19
days

81 4.1.1 Execute Ground Lease 10 days Thu
2/24/11

19 days 41,45 IH

82 4.1.2 Execute REA 10 days Thu
2/24/11

19 days 41,46 IH

83 4.2 OWNERSHI P 5 days Wed
1/26/11

45
days

84 4.2.1 UHT Partnership

Agreement

5 days Wed
1/26/11

45 days 52,49 MM

85 4.3 DEBT FI NANCI NG 642
days

Fri 4/1/11 0 days

86 4.3.1 Prepare Finance

Package

5 days Mon
9/22/08

0 days 58 MM,SA

87 4.3.2 Identify prospective

lenders

1 day Tue
9/16/08

0 days 86SS MM

88 4.3.3 Finance Package Issued 1 day Mon
1/10/11

22 days 86,87,41 MM,SA

89 4.3.4 Obtain Builder's Risk

Insurance Quotes

10 days Mon
1/24/11

45 days 88 SA,MM

90 4.3.5 Bind Builder's Risk

Insurance

2 days Wed
1/26/11

45 days 89 MM,SA

91 4.3.6 Order Updated Title

Report

5 days Mon
1/17/11

22 days 44,43,88 SA

92 4.3.7 Updated Title Review 5 days Mon
1/24/11

22 days 91 MM

Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e Mar
Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 201 Qtr 2, 201 Qtr 3, 201 Qtr 4, 201 Qtr 1, 201 Qtr 2, 201 Qtr 3, 201 Qtr 4, 201 Qtr 1, 201

Task

Critical Task

Progress

Milestone

Summary

Rolled Up Task

Rolled Up Critical Task

Rolled Up Milestone

Rolled Up Progress

Split

External Tasks

Project Summary

Group By Summary

Deadline

Page 2

Project: PCH Avondale Clinic
Date: Thu 10/7/10



ID Task Name Duration Finish Total
Slack

Predecessors Resource
Initials

93 4.3.8 Order ALTA Survey 20 days Mon
2/21/11

22 days 92 SA

94 4.3.9 Finalize Title Report 5 days Mon
2/28/11

22 days 93 MM

95 4.3.10 Receive Lender

Responses

10 days Mon
1/24/11

36 days 88 MM

96 4.3.11 Process and evaluate

Lender Responses

5 days Mon
1/31/11

36 days 95 MM

97 4.3.12 Lender Selected 1 day Tue
2/1/11

36 days 96 MM

98 4.3.13 Loan Documents

Negotiated

5 days Tue
2/8/11

36 days 97 MM

99 4.3.14 Loan Closed 2 days Fri 4/1/11 0 days 2,84,94,50,80FS+5
days,90

MM,SA

100 4.4 PROJECT DESI GN 110
days

Fri
11/21/08

0 days

106 4.5 BUDGET 285
days

Tue
1/12/10

0 days

107 4.5.1 Final CD Pricing from

Contractor

250 days Thu
11/19/09

0 days 64,102

108 4.5.2 Update Development

Model

30 days Tue
1/5/10

0 days 107 MM

109 4.5.3 Release Udated Open

Book Model

5 days Tue
1/12/10

0 days 108 MM

110 4.6 CONSTRUCTI ON 58 days Wed
3/30/11

0 days

111 4.6.1 Draft & Negotiate

Construction Contract

57 days Tue
3/29/11

0 days 64,107,41 MM

112 4.6.2 Execute Construction

Contract

1 day Wed
3/30/11

0 days 107,111 MM

113 4.7 PROJECT SCHEDULE 39 days Tue
1/19/10

0 days

116 4.8 GOVERNMENT ENTI TLEMENTS 616
days

Fri
3/25/11

202
days

117 4.8.1 Establish Tax Parcel 580 days Thu
2/3/11

238
days

71 MM

118 4.8.2 Permit Submittal 44 days Wed
1/21/09

0 days 101 IH

Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e Mar
Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 201 Qtr 2, 201 Qtr 3, 201 Qtr 4, 201 Qtr 1, 201 Qtr 2, 201 Qtr 3, 201 Qtr 4, 201 Qtr 1, 201

Task

Critical Task

Progress

Milestone

Summary

Rolled Up Task

Rolled Up Critical Task

Rolled Up Milestone

Rolled Up Progress

Split

External Tasks

Project Summary

Group By Summary

Deadline

Page 3

Project: PCH Avondale Clinic
Date: Thu 10/7/10



ID Task Name Duration Finish Total
Slack

Predecessors Resource
Initials

119 4.8.3 Permit Appoved by

Avondale

1 day Thu
1/22/09

0 days 118 IH

120 4.8.4 Permit Received 550 days Fri
3/25/11

5 days 119

121 4.9 FI NAL

DEVELOPMENT

ANALYSI S

0 days Tue
1/19/10

243
days

108,115 IH,MM

122
5 START

CONSTRUCTI ON

197
days

Tue
1/3/12

0 days

123
5.1 Site & Shell

Construction

197
days

Tue
1/3/12

0 days

124 5.1.1 Notice to proceed 1 day Mon
4/4/11

0 days 99,120 RL

125 5.1.2 Contractor Schedule 186 days Tue
12/20/11

0 days 124 RL

126 5.1.3 Contractor Change

Order Schedule

0 days Tue
12/20/11

0 days 125 RL

127 5.1.4 Contingency Schedule 10 days Tue
1/3/12

0 days 126 RL

128
5.2 OPEN BUI LDI NG

0 days Tue
12/20/11

10 days 126

Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e MarApr a Jun Jul u e Oct o e Jan e Mar
Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 200 Qtr 2, 200 Qtr 3, 200 Qtr 4, 200 Qtr 1, 201 Qtr 2, 201 Qtr 3, 201 Qtr 4, 201 Qtr 1, 201 Qtr 2, 201 Qtr 3, 201 Qtr 4, 201 Qtr 1, 201

Task

Critical Task

Progress

Milestone

Summary

Rolled Up Task

Rolled Up Critical Task

Rolled Up Milestone

Rolled Up Progress

Split

External Tasks

Project Summary

Group By Summary

Deadline

Page 4

Project: PCH Avondale Clinic
Date: Thu 10/7/10



Exhibit D 









Exhibit E 



Exhibit F





Exhibit G









Exhibit H 

City Council Regular Meeting – Excerpts of Meeting Minutes 

October 20, 2008 

 

(Note:  The following minutes include presentations and discussion on both the Rezoning 

and Site Plan applications for Phoenix Children’s Hospital.  To reduce confusion the 

motion and vote for the rezoning has been deleted from this excerpt) 

8)       PUBLIC HEARING AND ORDINANCE 1333-1008 – PHOENIX 

CHILDREN’S HOSPITAL REZONING (Z-08-5)  

            A public hearing and consideration of a request from Mr. Stephen Earl of Earl, 
Curley and LaGarde on behalf of Phoenix Children’s Hospital for the rezoning of 
12.6 acres located at the northeast corner of McDowell Road and Avondale Blvd. 
from C-1 (Neighborhood Commercial) to PAD (Planned Area Development).   

9)       PHOENIX CHILDREN’S HOSPITAL MASTER SITE PLAN (DR-08-5)  

            Consideration of a request from Mr. Ron Meyer of HKS, Inc. on behalf of 
Phoenix Children’s Hospital for master and final site plan approval for a medical 
campus on a 12.6 acre parcel located at the northeast corner of Avondale Blvd. 
and McDowell Road.   

            Charlie McClendon, City Manager, stated that Ken Galica would present items 8 
and 9 together; although, they will require separate actions.   

Ken Galica, Planner II, Development Services Department, stated that staff is 
recommending approval of two applications for Phoenix Children’s Hospital, Z-
08-5, (rezoning), and DR-08-5, (Master Site Plan approval).  A public hearing is 
required for the rezoning application. The property is roughly 12.5 acres, it’s 
zoned C-1 (Neighborhood Commercial) and is located at the northeast corner of 
Avondale Blvd. and McDowell Road.  The General Plan designates the subject 
property as Commercial and is within the Freeway Corridor Specific Plan. The 
proposed PAD has a highly limited list of permitted uses that are primarily 
medically related, such as medical offices and laboratories, surgery centers, 
hospitals, etc., as well as traditional accessory uses such as gift shops.  All the 
uses, except for hospital, are allowed within the C-2 (Community Commercial) 
district.  Hospitals are allowed in the C-3 (Freeway Commercial) district.  The 
Freeway Corridor Plan indicates that this location is suitable for regional 
development.   

Mr. Galica stated that the development standards are based almost entirely on the 
C-1 (Neighborhood Commercial) zoning district with some help from the 
Freeway Corridor Plan.  There are two deviations from these standards.  The 
applicant is proposing a parking ratio for the hospital use at 1 space for each 400 
square feet of floor area.  The standard of 1 to 400 is comparable to the standards 
used by cities such as Goodyear and Mesa.  Avondale’s current standard is 1 to 



Exhibit H 

200.  Staff researched the issue and decided they can support the 1 to 400 ratio.  
He added that Staff will probably look at revising Avondale’s parking standards 
to fall in line with that of other cities.  The second deviation is that the applicant is 
proposing landscape setbacks from McDowell Road which are less than the 
Freeway Corridor Plan requirement of 40 feet.  Those areas are when the 
deceleration lane into the turn lane cuts into the site.  78% of the frontage exceeds 
the minimum setback requirement of 40 feet, and the average setback is 
approximately 65 feet.  Staff feels these setbacks more than adequately make up 
for the limited instances where the setback is around 36-37 feet. 

The PAD has design standards tied to the conceptual elevations included in the 
development plan narrative.  The architecture on the site will use Phoenix 
Children’s Hospital’s trademark vibrant colors and geometric shapes.  The 
building features changes in wall planes and use of textured material to create 
visual interest.  Landscaping will be provided throughout the site in excess of the 
minimum requirements of the Zoning Ordinance.   

Access to the site will be provided from a full access driveway at the northwest 
corner of the site from Avondale Blvd., and a full access driveway at the southeast 
corner of the site from McDowell Road.  The Staff Reports indicates that the 
McDowell Road access will be a three-point access; however, the City’s Engineer 
has determined that the intersection would be best serviced by a full access and 
one of the stipulations has thus been revised.  An additional right-in/right-out 
driveway is located south of the primary entrance off of Avondale Blvd.  Through 
a Development Agreement, the City will be handling the design and construction 
of McDowell Road and the City will be reimbursed the full cost of those 
improvements by the hospital when the hospital phase is constructed, which 
according to the applicant, is probably about five to six years off.  The 
Development Agreement will be presented for Council approval within the next 
month or so. 

Mr. Galica explained that the site plan includes three buildings totaling roughly 
167,000 square feet in floor area.  The first phase will include a 36,000 square 
foot clinic/urgent care facility and a 36,000 square foot medical office building.  
A 114,000 square foot hospital will be built at a later phase.  When this occurs, 
the urgent care facility will be converted into an emergency room.  The site also 
includes an outdoor service yard of approximately 11,000 square feet to house 
mechanical equipment required by the hospital, which will be screened by an 8 
foot masonry wall with a combination of the natural color of masonry and orange 
glazing applied to the masonry.  The proposed Master Site Plan provides a total of 
603 parking spaces dispersed in a series of smaller lots.  The proposal exceeds 
minimum requirements established by the PAD by 51 spaces and meets or 
exceeds all ADA requirements.   

The site plan has taken numerous measures to ensure that potential impacts of the 
facility on surrounding residential uses are mitigated.  The buildings are a 



Exhibit H 

minimum of 50 square feet away from any residential property line.  Windows 
overlooking residential yards are sparsely populated, and a 10 to 12 foot 
landscape buffer including 24 inch box trees is provided along property lines 
which abut residential lots.   

Mr. Galica stated the landscape plan has a mix of Evergreen Elms, Palo Verde, 
Chitalpas, Thornless Mesquites, Western Redbuds, Purple Leaf Plums, Date Palm 
trees, 17 varieties of shrubs and be four types of accents and ground cover 
provided.  The applicant has provided 349 trees on the site, 235 of which are the 2 
inch caliper, 24 inch box size.  Staff has included a stipulation to increase the size 
of 114 trees which are smaller than 2 inches in caliper.  The site plan includes two 
outdoor areas designed for pedestrians including a plaza at the southwest corner 
of the site and a garden area to the east of the hospital building.  Staff has 
recommended a stipulation stating that seating, trash receptacles, decorative 
paving, and pedestrian lighting be provided in these areas.   

The proposed architecture is contemporary.  The public-facing elevations will 
bring energy and variety to the area.  The materiel includes six varieties of 
exposed block and aluminum paneling coated in vibrant shades of green, yellow, 
purple, red, silver, white, and orange.  Use of color is primarily used at the major 
building entry points in order to establish these as focal points of the facility.  
Earth tone colors are emphasized on the east and north-facing elevations to ensure 
compatibility with the adjacent residences.  All four sides of the building 
incorporate tremendous change in wall plane to create shadowing.   

Staff finds that the rezoning request and site plan application meet all required 
findings for approval.  On September 18, 2008, the Planning Commission 
recommended approval of the rezoning application subject to 10 stipulations, 
three of which were deleted after reviewing them with the applicant; staff is 
therefore recommending approval subject to seven stipulations. The Planning 
Commission also recommended approval of the Site Plan application subject to 
25 stipulations; three of which have been deleted by staff.  Mr. Galica reported 
that after the Staff Reports were distributed, the City Engineer determined that a 
full access driveway on McDowell Road will be the best option.  Staff 
recommends approval of the Site Pan application subject to 21 stipulations.   

Mayor Lopez Rogers invited questions and comments. 

In response to a question from Vice Mayor Weise, Mr. Galica indicated that only 
one resident attended the neighborhood meeting and endorsed the project; he 
added another neighborhood called to ask when the ambulances would turn their 
sirens off on approach to the facility.  The hospital indicated their policy is for 
ambulances to turn off sirens as soon as the ambulances pass the nearest public 
street intersection. 



Exhibit H 

Vice Mayor Weise asked what would be done to mitigate the truck traffic 
generated by the facility.  Mr. Galica replied that the site is designed for flow of 
service vehicles and to accommodate pedestrians and traditional automobile 
traffic.   

Vice Mayor Weise asked if the applicant had any plans to have a NICU (Neonatal 
Intensive Care Unit) in Avondale.   

Steven Earl, 3101 N. Central Avenue, Phoenix, AZ, stated his group represents 
the Phoenix Children’s Hospital.  A wonderful new NICU facility has been 
introduced at the main campus, the Avondale campus will be a full service 
hospital.  They plan to open phases one and two at about this time next year, with 
the hospital planned for four or five years down the road.  The main campus will 
be the finest children’s hospital in the United States.  He added that the Avondale 
campus, which will be called the Avondale Hospital. 

Council Member Karlin asked if there would be a bus bay.  Mr. Galica replied 
that one of the stipulations for site plan approval is to show a bus bay on the final 
construction plans.  There will be one on Avondale Blvd.   

            Mayor Lopez Rogers opened item 8 for public hearing.   

Mayor Lopez Rogers stated this is a great opportunity and the City is very excited 
about the project.  She closed the public hearing and asked to have the ordinance 
read. 

            Mayor Lopez Rogers called for a motion on item 9, Master Site Plan.  Andrew 
McGuire, City Attorney, stated that language regarding dropped Stipulation No. 
20 should be included in the motion.  

           Vice Mayor Weise moved to approve the site plan subject to 21 Staff-
recommended stipulations, excluding stipulation #20.  Council Member Karlin 
seconded the motion. 

1.         Development shall be in conformance with the Site Plan, Landscape Plan, 
Building Elevations, Project Narrative, and Supplemental Color Palette 
date stamped September 3, 2008 and Materials Boards and Sign Program 
date stamped April 10, 2008, except as modified by these stipulations. 

2.         The plan approval expires in one year from date of approval unless a 
building permit has been issued. 

3.         All off-site improvements including landscaping within the right-of-way 
shall occur as part of the first phase. 



Exhibit H 

4.         A pavement change (pavers, colored concrete, etc.) shall be used in all 
instances where public or private sidewalks cross driveways or aisles on 
the site.  The design and color of this design element shall be shown on 
final plans and approved by Staff prior to issuance of a civil permit. 

5.         All trees utilized on the site are required to have minimum calipers of 2 
inches.  Multi-trunked trees may have smaller caliper measurements but 
must meet industry standards for 24” box trees.  Final plans must be 
updated to reflect this stipulation, including, but not limited to, the 
upsizing of trees in landscape buffers adjacent to residentially zoned 
parcels. 

6.         At a minimum, the areas denoted as “Pedestrian Plaza” and “Garden 
Area” must contain the following items:  pedestrian seating, trash 
receptacles, pedestrian lighting, and decorative paving.  Final design of 
these pedestrian areas must be shown on final plans to be approved by 
Staff prior to issuance of a building permit. 

7.         Turf shall be provided in the retention basin at the southwest corner of the 
site (Basin #1) and in the basin immediately southeast of the future 
hospital phase (Basin #3) to make these areas usable and enhance the 
aesthetic. 

8.         Trees must be planted in all parking lot landscape islands.   

9.         All freestanding parking lot lighting shall be located within landscape 
islands or planters. 

10.       Covered parking shall be provided on the site.  The location and design of 
parking canopies will be approved by Staff prior to issuance of a building 
permit. 

11.       Final construction plans shall use Avondale Datum for the benchmark. 

12.       Final Landscape plans shall show the existing SRP easement along 
McDowell Road for the 69kv power poles and coordination with SRP for 
approved plants must be reflected. 

13.       Final Grading and Drainage and Civil Plans shall reflect the updated 
reflection of the McDowell driveway entrance shown on the approved site 
plan. 

14.       Since catch basins are sized for the 10 year flood, the following standards 
are to be met on the final construction documents: 



Exhibit H 

a.         Depth in parking lots shall not exceed six (6) inches, nor shall it 
exceed two (2) inches at the midpoint of any parking space for the 
100 year 2 hour storm. 

b.         A continuous emergency vehicle access lane shall be provided 
throughout the development, and it shall be free of ponded water 
from the retention areas. 

15.       The storm drain pipe between Basin 2 and Basin 3 does not function as 
shown.  A resolution shall be worked out with Staff in the final 
construction plans. 

16.       Final Drainage Report that is submitted with final construction documents 
is to reflect a rainfall depth of 2.7 inches. 

17.      The developer will be required to relocate the traffic signal on the northeast 
corner of Avondale Blvd., and McDowell Road will be required to be 
relocated prior to issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy. 

18.       A bus stop transit pad will be required for northbound traffic on Avondale 
Blvd. and shown on the final construction plans. 

19.      All turn lane storage lengths shall have a minimum stacking as per the 
results and recommendations of the traffic study and per City standards.  
In addition, minimum taper lengths for right turn deceleration lane are 
required to be 100 feet unless otherwise approved by the City Traffic 
Engineer.  For the right turn deceleration lane on McDowell Road, length 
and taper may overlap into adjacent property and any necessary right-of-
way should be coordinated with owner.  Final plans shall provide 
accordingly. 

20.       A porkchop design per City approval will be required for the partial access 
opening at the driveway connection to McDowell Road (a partial opening 
¾ access) to restrict left turning moments out of the site. 

21.       Additional ROW dedication will be required if needed for any off-site 
improvements required to be provided with this development per City 
standards, such as for turn lanes, deceleration lanes, intersection 
improvements and transit stops. 

22.       A signing and pavement marking plan will be required at the time of Civil 
Improvement Plan review for both on-site and off-site.  For on-site, it shall 
include but not be limited to additional pedestrian access paths, “Do Not 
Block Intersection” signs and striping at the intersection the ambulance 
will use, internal traffic control such as stop signs, etc.  For off-site items 
it shall include, but not be limited to, restriping beyond the site property 



Exhibit H 

lines in order to accommodate striping and signage needed for turn lanes 
and tapers, “No U-Turn” signs, installation and reconfiguration of the 
raised medians.  All applicable results and recommendations from the 
traffic study for signing and striping shall be incorporated into the plans. 

            Mayor Lopez Rogers invited further discussion, and seeing none, called for a 
vote. 

ROLL CALL VOTE AS FOLLOWS: 

                        Council Member Scott     Aye 

                        Council Member Buster           Aye 

                        Mayor Lopez-Rogers               Aye 

                        Vice Mayor Weise                   Aye 

                        Council Member Wolf    Excused 

                        Council Member Karlin             Aye 

                        Council Member McDonald      Aye 

            The motion passed unanimously. 

 



DEVELOPMENT 
SERVICES

SUBJECT: 
Public Hearing - Time Extension for Papago 

Commerce Center PAD zoning 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

  

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Sue McDermott, Director of Development Services and Engineering (623) 333-4211

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager (623) 333-1015

REQUEST: Hold a public hearing and extend the period allowed for commencement of 
development within the Papago Commerce Center PAD for one year from the date of 
expiration, until October 15, 2011

PARCEL 

SIZE:

Approximately 11.1 Gross Acres

LOCATION: Southeast Corner of El Mirage Road and Interstate 10 (Exhibits A and B)

APPLICANT: Mr. Erich Stiger, iStar Financial Inc. (415) 391-4300

OWNER: iStar Financial, Inc. 

BACKGROUND:

The property was annexed into the City of Avondale on July 2, 1984 and was subsequently rezoned 
from AG (Agricultural) to Planned Area Development (PAD) on October 15, 2007. The approved 
Papago Commerce Center PAD requires development of the site in accordance with the uses and 
requirements of the Commerce Park (CP) Zoning District. The development plan proposes a mix of 
uses including office and fully enclosed light industrial, as well as a few limited retail/commercial 
uses. The original applicant for this site, RDB Construction and Management, envisioned this 
property as a future phase of the Avondale Commerce Center development that has been built to the 
west of this site. RDB no longer owns either site. 
 
Primary access to the site is to be provided from El Mirage Road along the western property 
boundary. Secondary access will be provided through the property to the south, property to the east, 
or both. To comply with fire code requirements, a stipulation of the 2007 rezoning approval states 
that development of the eastern half of the subject property cannot commence until at least one of 
these access points can be installed.  
 
A site plan for the subject property was never submitted following approval of the PAD in 2007.  
 
The property is designated by the General Plan Land Use Map as Employment. The Employment 
designation encourages facilities that provide employment opportunities by allowing uses that 
include general office, enclosed industrial uses and retail and limited commercial uses that support 
office and industrial. Additionally, the property is located within the Freeway Corridor Specific Plan 
area with a land use designation of Employment. The approved PAD remains consistent with these 
General Plan and Freeway Corridor Specific Plan designations.  
 
The Zoning Ordinance allows up to three years from the date of the original zoning approval to 
commence development within a PAD in order to prevent its expiration. The Zoning Ordinance 

 



specifies that prior to expiration, the property owner or an authorized representative may submit an 
application for extension to the City; the City Council may grant up to four (4) one-year extensions of 
the time condition.  
 
Approval of this request for a one-year extension will extend the deadline for development to occur 
within the Papago Commerce Center PAD through October 15, 2011. Should no development occur 
prior to that date, the property owners or authorized representatives will be able to request up to 
three additional one-year extensions under the terms of the PAD Ordinance. 

SUMMARY OF REQUEST:

The applicant is requesting that the City Council grant a one-year extension for the Papago 
Commerce Center PAD approval. This request represents the first extension for this particular PAD. 
The Zoning Ordinance allows for no more than four one year extensions to be granted.  
 
The primary reasons stated by the applicant (Exhibit C) as justification for the extension request 
include: 

n Despite the current minimal tenant demand, significant funds are being invested in the adjacent 
Avondale Commerce Center development in an effort to fill empty tenant spaces. The property 
owner of both the Avondale Commerce Center and Papago Commerce Center sites wishes to 
extend this approval to allow for immediate development when the opportunity presents itself.  

n It would be detrimental to both the City and property owner to start a rezoning process from the 
beginning in the future. The applicant states that the City and property owner need to be 
positioned to accommodate a potential employer when the opportunity arises rather than 
potentially lose business to other municipalities.  

PARTICIPATION:

Public notifications are not required for PAD Extensions. 

PLANNING COMMISSION ACTION:

The Planning Commission does not review PAD Extensions. 

ANALYSIS:

Conformance with General Plan and Freeway Corridor Specific Plan 
 
The property is designated as Employment by the General Plan and falls within the boundaries of 
the of the Freeway Corridor Specific Plan (FCSP). All permitted and conditional uses listed in the 
PAD are still considered appropriate for a property designated as Employment by the General Plan. 
The PAD also remains in conformance with the enhanced design requirements for properties within 
the “freeway frontage” sub-area of the FCSP. In summary, the PAD remains in total conformance 
with both the General Plan and Freeway Corridor Specific Plan.  
 
Conformance with the Zoning Ordinance and Design Manual 
 
In the three years since the PAD was approved in October 2007, the City has updated and amended 
several Zoning Ordinance sections and also has adopted the Design Manual for Commercial, 
Industrial, and Multi-Family Residential Development. However, because the majority of 
development and design standards contained within the Papago Commerce Center PAD refer back 
to relevant Zoning Ordinance sections, the PAD remains in conformance with the Zoning Ordinance 
except in a few instances specified in the bulleted list, below. For instance, rather than prescribing 
customized landscaping standards in the PAD Development Plan, the text simply states that, 
“landscaping shall comply with City of Avondale landscaping requirements.” Because the PAD was 
 



 
written in that general fashion, future development on the site will be required to adhere to the City's 
most current version of Zoning Ordinance Section 12, Landscaping, Walls, and Fences.  
 
The PAD is not in conformance with City requirements in the following areas: 
 

l The PAD contains its own specific set of building and site design standards which are not as 
strong as the design standards listed in the Design Manual. A stipulation is recommended that 
future development of the site be required to adhere to the Design Manual for Commercial, 
Industrial, and Multi-Family Residential Development. In instances where there is a conflict 
between the PAD's design language and the Design Manual, the stipulation specifies that the 
Design Manual shall supersede.  

l The PAD was approved prior to adoption of Zoning Ordinance Section 11, the City's Public Art 
Ordinance. A stipulation is recommended that future development on the site comply with the 
terms of Section 11.  

l This past summer the City's Outdoor Lighting standards were revised as part of the 
amendment to Zoning Ordinance Section 7, Supplementary Regulations. Outdoor Lighting is 
one of only a few sections for which the approved PAD does not refer back to the Zoning 
Ordinance. As such, a stipulation is recommended that future development on the site comply 
with the requirements of Zoning Ordinance Section 707, Outdoor Lighting.  

Conclusion 
 
With staff recommended stipulations, the uses, standards, and requirements contained within the 
Papago Commerce Center PAD are in conformance with the General Plan and current Zoning 
Ordinance standards. As such, staff recommends that the PAD zoning be extended. 

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends that the City Council hold a public hearing and approve the time extension 
request for the Papago Commerce Center PAD for one year from the date of expiration, until 
October 15, 2011, subject to the following stipulations: 
 
1.Unless listed below, all standards, requirements, and stipulations of the Papago Commerce Center 
PAD approval from October 15, 2007 shall remain in full force and effect.  
 
2.Site and building design shall be in conformance with the City of Avondale Design Manual for 
Commercial, Industrial, and Multi-Family Residential Development. Where there are conflicts 
between the PAD's “Design Standards” and the City's Design Manual, the standards contained 
within the Design Manual shall supersede.  
 
3.Outdoor site lighting shall be in conformance with City of Avondale Zoning Ordinance Section 707, 
Outdoor Lighting. Where there are conflicts between the PAD's lighting language and Zoning 
Ordinance Section 707, the language contained within Section 707 shall supersede.  
 
4.Public art shall be provided in accordance with the Avondale Zoning Ordinance Section 11, Public 
Art. 

PROPOSED MOTION:

I move that the City Council GRANT a time extension for the Papago Commerce Center Planned 
Area Development (PAD) for one year from the date of expiration, until October 15, 2011, subject to 
the staff recommended stipulations.  
 
 



ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

Exhibit A - Zoning Vicinity Map

Exhibit B - Aerial Photograph

Exhibit C - Applicant’s Extension Request, date stamped October 12, 2010 

Exhibit D - Approved Papago Commerce Center PAD 

Exhibit E - Ordinance 1272-1007, approving the Papago Commerce Center PAD

Exhibit F - Excerpt from City Council Minutes, Regular Meeting of October 15, 2007 (PAD Approval)

PROJECT MANAGER:

Ken Galica, Planner II (623) 333-4019







Exhibit C





Exhibit D











































Exhibit E















Exhibit F 
 

City Council Regular Meeting – Excerpt of Meeting Minutes 

October 15, 2007 

 

PUBLIC HEARING AND ORDINANCE 1272-1007 – PAPAGO COMMERCE 

CENTER REZONING (Z-07-5)  
 
Ken Galica, Planner II, Development Services Department, explained this item 
was a rezoning application for Papago Commerce Center, approximately 11 acres 
located at the southeast corner of I-10 and El Mirage Road, currently zoned AG.  
Mr. Galica showed the Council an aerial photo of the subject property, pointing 
out vehicular access.  He stated the subject property is designated as Employment 
by the General Plan and it falls within the Freeway Corridor Specific Plan, and 
the Employment land use encourages office and enclosed industrial uses, as well 
as modest amounts of retail which support the office and industrial uses.  Mr. 
Galica informed the Council that the proposed office, distribution, and light 
manufacturing uses are consistent with the Commerce Park zoning district and the 
Employment land use designation, and the proposed Conditional Uses are 
consistent with the PADs approved in the vicinity.  He reported the PAD 
development plan contains standards designed to encourage outstanding 
architecture through the inclusion of landscaping, signage and building design 
standards which will ensure a quality development of the subject property, and all 
development standards proposed for the property are identical to those in the 
Commerce Park district with the exception of an increase in building height from 
35 to 45 feet.  Mr. Galica explained that Staff feels this building height increase is 
appropriate considering the parcel location is adjacent to the freeway.  He stated a 
Master Site Plan for the site, which will include reviews of materials, colors, 
landscaping, etc., will come before the City Council at a later date. 
 
Mr. Galica reported this request for rezoning meets the requirements of the 
Zoning Ordinance, will result in compatible land use relationships, and will 
produce the quality of development which is consistent with the desired character 
for the area.  He stated that with the recommended stipulations, the Papago 
Commerce Center PAD is consistent with the objectives of the General Plan and 
the Freeway Corridor Specific Plan.  He reported that on September 20, 2007, the 
Planning Commission recommended approval of the application subject to 10 
stipulations.   
 
Mayor Lopez Rogers opened the item for public hearing.  There were no requests 
to speak.   
 
Council Member Buster stated he received a call regarding a lack of the ability for 
churches to buy property and to expand which had occurred since the housing 
boom and the gobbling up of real estate by large developers.  While he is not sure 
the call was in reference to this item or the last item, he pointed out a church had 
looked at a parcel in terms of leasing space. Mr. Galica responded this issue 
regarded the phase that is currently under construction just to the west of El 



Exhibit F 
 

Mirage Road where a church had looked at moving in, and the zoning does not 
allow for churches.  He explained that churches were not considered compatible 
with employment types of uses because of the differences in parking 
requirements, pointing out that employment type uses require 1 space for every 
500 square feet, and even less for areas that are strictly for warehousing and 
inventory storage; whereas, churches require much more parking.  He added that 
churches were allowed in all commercial zoning districts, in some residential 
districts, and in some PAD districts, some subject to a Conditional Use Permit. 
 
Council Member Buster stated this was an ongoing problem and perhaps he needs 
to talk with Staff about it because it was becoming all too common. 
 
Charlie McClendon, City Manager, suggested that Council Member Buster refer 
the caller to the Economic Development staff or the Planning staff who are very 
familiar with inventory of property that might be available in the community that 
would be suitable for a church and they would be happy to work with the caller.   
 
Mayor Lopez Rogers closed the public hearing. 
 
Andrew McGuire, City Attorney, read Ordinance 1272-1007 – Papago Commerce 
Center Rezoning (Z-07-5), by title only.   
 
Vice Mayor Wolf moved to approve the Ordinance subject to the 10 stipulations 
recommended by Staff.   
 
1) Development shall conform to the Papago Commerce Center General 

Development Plan date stamped August 9, 2007, except as modified by these 
stipulations.  2) Retail commercial operations directly related to the primary 
industrial use shall not exceed ten (10) percent of the gross floor area of any 
single tenant except with a Conditional Use Permit, where up to thirty (30) 
percent may be allowed.  3) Freestanding freeway identification signage shall 
not be allowed.  4) A Master Site Plan shall be approved by the City Council 
prior to development.  Subsequently, plans and permits may be 
administratively approved by staff or this development in accordance with the 
Council-approved Master Site Plan and Comprehensive Sign Program.  5) 
Right-of-way dedication and street improvements shall be required as follows:  
Street right-of-way required street improvements - El Mirage Road 60’ half 
street adjacent to property.  (Major Collector) 2 travel lanes, bike lane, curb 
and gutter, sidewalks, street lights and landscaping.  6) Additional right-of-
way may be required at Site Plan approval for improvements based upon the 
results of the revised Traffic Study and the Site Plan application, as 
determined by the City Engineer.  7) A full Traffic Impact Analysis shall be 
required at the time of Master Site Plan approval.  8) All water rights on the 
property shall be conveyed to the City of Avondale prior to issuance of a 
building permit or approval of a final plat, whichever is first.  9) Development 
of the eastern half of the Papago Commerce Center property may not 



Exhibit F 
 

commence until a secondary access point can be built.  10) The Master Site 
Plan shall be approved by ADOT prior to Site Plan approval by the City of 
Avondale.   

 
Council Member Weise seconded the motion. 

 
ROLL CALL VOTE AS FOLLOWS: 
 
  Council Member Earp  Excused 
  Council Member Scott Excused 
  Council Member Buster Aye 
  Mayor Lopez-Rogers  Aye 
  Vice Mayor Wolf  Aye 
  Council Member Lynch Aye 
  Council Member Weise Aye 
 
 Motion carried unanimously. 

 



CITY COUNCIL REPORT

SUBJECT: 
EXECUTIVE SESSION 

MEETING DATE: 
December 6, 2010 

 
 

TO: Mayor and Council

FROM: Andrew McGuire, City Attorney (602) 257-7664

THROUGH: Charlie McClendon, City Manager

PURPOSE:

The Council may hold an executive session pursuant to ARIZ. REV. STAT. § 38-431.03 (A)(3) for 
discussion or consultation for legal advice with the City Attorney regarding options for addressing 
Proposition 203 approved by Arizona voters on November 2, 2010. 

ATTACHMENTS: 

Click to download

No Attachments Available 

 


	Work Session Agenda 
	2.- Proposed Amendments to Avondale MunicipalCode - Chapter 4 - Building Regulations
	12.6.10 regular meeting.pdf
	Regular Meeting Agenda 
	Special Event Liquor Licenses - Raceway Elks -Fundraising Events
	First Amendment to Financial AssistanceAgreement - Care1st Health Plan Arizona, Inc.
	Payment Authorization - Southwest GasCorporation for Line Relocations for the Elm LaneDrainage Improvement Project
	Purchase of Four Patrol Cars for the NewNorthwest Public Safety Facility
	Construction Contract Award - StandardConstruction Company, Inc - Well 5 Well SiteImprovements
	Purchase Agreement - Polydyne, Inc.
	Resolution 2936-1210 - IntergovernmentalAgreement - Tolleson Union High School DistrictNo. 214 – Traffic Signal at Westview High School
	Appointment of Members to the City's Boards,Commission and Committees and to the positionsof Chair and Vice Chair of the PlanningCommission
	Public Hearing - Ordinance - Use of Fireworks
	Master and Final Site Plan Approval Extension -Avondale Phoenix Children’s Hospital
	Public Hearing - Time Extension for PapagoCommerce Center PAD zoning
	EXECUTIVE SESSION


