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1 100 Watt HPS Lamp/Mogel Base/S54 590 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $11.51 $6,790.90 $9.82 $5,793.80 $0.00

2 150 Watt HPS Lamp/Mogel Base/S55 250 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $10.32 $2,580.00 $9.82 $2,455.00 $0.00

3 250 Watt HPS Lamp/Mogel Base/S50 170 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $12.49 $2,123.30 $10.39 $1,766.30 $0.00

4 400 Watt HPS Lamp/Mogel Base/S51 5 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $12.49 $62.45 $14.62 $73.10 $0.00

5
100 Watt HPS Cobra Luminaire, GE - 

M2AC10SOA2GMC22
55 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $182.45 $10,034.75 $158.67 $8,726.85 $0.00

6
150 Watt HPS Cobra Luminaire, GE - 

M2AC15SOA2GMC32
15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $191.14 $2,867.10 $190.34 $2,855.10 $0.00

7
250 Watt HPS Cobra Luminaire, GE - 

M2AC25SOA2GMC32
15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $193.31 $2,899.65 $192.68 $2,890.20 $0.00

8
250 Watt HPS Shoebox Luminaire, GE - 

DSME25SOA2GMC3DBC
5 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

9
250 Watt HPS Shoebox Luminaire, GE - 

TSP25SOA2FMC3SDB
15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

10
Luminaire 67 Watt LED RWGR (APN# 128330) GE – 

ERS10CXBX5402GRAY
55 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $278.02 $15,291.10 $294.27 $16,184.85 $0.00

11
Luminaire 130 Watt LED RWGR (APN# 128332) GE – 

ERS20HXEX5402GRAY
15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $403.99 $6,059.85 $427.39 $6,410.85 $0.00

12
Luminaire 258 Watt LED RWGR (APN# 128364) GE – 

ERS40TXCX5402GRAY
15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $718.93 $10,783.95 $757.86 $11,367.90 $0.00

13
Luminaire 258 Watt LED RWDB (APN# 128365) GE – 

ERS40TXCX5402DKBZ
15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $718.93 $10,783.95 $757.86 $11,367.90 $0.00

14 INTENTIONALLY OMITTED 5 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

15 GE Evolve LED 108 Watt- RS1011D1X20ADKBZ 5 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $396.39 $1,981.95 $398.20 $1,991.00 $0.00

16 GE Evolve LED 232 Watt -ERS20F3A11402DKBZL 5 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $591.87 $2,959.35 $593.21 $2,966.05 $0.00

17 GE Evolve LED 157 Watt- ERMC0A360AZDKBZ 5 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $367.07 $1,835.35 $366.67 $1,833.35 $0.00

18
CREE Edge Series LED ARE-EDR-2M-R3-04-D-UL-SV-

525-40K-HL
20 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $992.60 $19,852.00 $992.58 $19,851.60 $0.00

19
CREE Edge Series LED ARE-EDR-3M-R3-12-C-UL-SV-

43K
10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $1,536.69 $15,366.90 $1,536.75 $15,367.50 $0.00

20 Phillips Advance LED Electronic Driver - XA-9033 10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

21 Phillips Advance LED Electronic Driver - XA-9363 20 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

22 100 Watt HPS Ballast Kit, Multi-tap 15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $56.47 $847.05 $56.29 $844.35 $0.00

23 150 Watt HPS Ballast Kit, Multi-tap 25 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $57.56 $1,439.00 $60.18 $1,504.50 $0.00

24 250 Watt HPS Ballast Kit, Multi-tap 10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $70.59 $705.90 $79.88 $798.80 $0.00

25 KTK-R–10 Midget Fuse 30 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $6.52 $195.60 $10.16 $304.80 $0.00

26 KTK-R-15 Midget Fuse 80 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $6.79 $543.20 $10.16 $812.80 $0.00
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27 HEB–AA Fuse Holder 15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $11.59 $173.85 $22.28 $334.20 $0.00

28 Bussman #2A0660 Rubber Boot Insulator 25 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $2.17 $54.25 $3.11 $77.75 $0.00

29 GE Glass Lens, M2AR10SOH 5 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $14.12 $70.60 $18.55 $92.75 $0.00

30 Photocontrol, ES124-WPJ-2.5 – TBK (Fail-On) 840 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $8.69 $7,299.60 $9.07 $7,618.80 $0.00

31
Intermatic Locking Type K4500 Photo Control Short cap 105-

480
10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $4.36 $43.60 $3.33 $33.30 $0.00

32 ESB-0432-14-UV Fluorescent Ballast 10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

33
Illuminated Street Name Sign Ballast Kit Model # 

EESB104014L
10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

34 Phillips F48T12 Fluorescent Lamp 15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $4.53 $67.95 $6.01 $90.15 $0.00

35 Phillips F72T12 Fluorescent Lamp 15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $22.50 $337.50 $4.92 $73.80 $0.00

36 Phillips F84T12 Fluorescent Lamp 15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $26.37 $395.55 $7.53 $112.95 $0.00

37 Phillips F96T12/CW/HO/EW/ALTO Fluorescent Lamp 90 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $10.86 $977.40 $3.03 $272.70 $0.00

38 Phillips F108T12 Fluorescent Lamp 15 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $30.41 $456.15 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

39 Phillips F120T12/CW/HO Fluorescent Lamp 90 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $30.41 $2,736.90 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

40 #12 Solid Wire, Copper, THHN, Black, 500’ Roll 500 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.12 $60.00 $0.09 $42.80 $0.00

41 #12 Solid Wire, Copper, THHN, White, 500’ Roll 500 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.12 $60.00 $0.09 $42.80 $0.00

42 #12 Solid Wire, Copper, THHN, Green, 500’ Roll 500 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.12 $60.00 $0.09 $42.80 $0.00

43 #12 Solid Wire, Copper, THHN, Red, 500’ Roll 500 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.12 $60.00 $0.09 $42.80 $0.00

44 SRP Pull Box; SRP Stock 5034692 (Per attached detail 44) 10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $102.08 $1,020.80 $86.05 $860.50 $0.00

45
APS Pull Box; T&D Construction Standards 8663 thru 8665 

(Per attached detail 45)
10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $55.39 $553.90 $285.21 $2,852.10 $0.00

46 26' 6" Pole (SRP Style) (Per attached detail 46) 5 $341.47 $1,707.35 $302.99 $1,514.95 $564.72 $2,823.60 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

47 3' Radius Mast Arm (SRP Style) (Per attached detail 47) 5 $66.02 $330.10 $60.82 $304.10 $83.62 $418.10 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

48 30’ 6” Pole (APS Style) (Per attached detail 48) 5 $365.17 $1,825.85 $364.90 $1,824.50 $451.78 $2,258.90 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

49 31' Pole (SRP Style) (Per attached detail 49) 25 $416.06 $10,401.50 $433.32 $10,833.00 $514.76 $12,869.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

50 6' Radius Mast Arm (SRP Style) (Per attached detail 50) 25 $83.99 $2,099.75 $90.14 $2,253.50 $106.43 $2,660.75 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

51

38' Square Direct Bury Pole Per APS Specs 8027 and 8030, 

31'-6" Above Ground, Code 1940.38, Bronze Powder Coat 

Paint (Per attached detail 51)

5 $619.61 $3,098.05 $547.35 $2,736.75 $880.75 $4,403.75 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

52
32' x 5” Square Architectural Pole (Foundation), Bronze 

Powser Coat Paint (Per attached detail 52)
10 $529.89 $5,298.90 $477.84 $4,778.40 $653.77 $6,537.70 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
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53
Square Architectural Pole Mast Arm (Single), Bronze 

Powder Coat Paint (Per attached detail 53)
5 $175.03 $875.15 $174.85 $874.25 $217.20 $1,086.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

54
Square Architectural Pole Mast Arm (Dual), Bronze Powder 

Coat Paint (Per attached detail 54)
5 $261.51 $1,307.55 $313.86 $1,569.30 $323.63 $1,618.15 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

55 38' 6" Round Pole (APS Style) (Per attached detail 55) 5 $535.77 $2,678.85 $561.47 $2,807.35 $661.37 $3,306.85 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

56 8' Mast Arm (APS Style) (Per attached detail 56) 5 $90.38 $451.90 $70.59 $352.95 $114.03 $570.15 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

57 Anchor Bolts (1” x 36” x 4”) (Per attached detail 57) 10 $64.13 $641.30 $16.29 $162.90 $84.71 $847.10 No Bid $0.00 $0.00

$128,756.80$30,716.25 $30,011.95

*All bids are presumed to include all applicable taxes.

TOTAL SUBMITTED BY BIDDER*

Met Requirements and Required Attachments Included?

Calculation or Extension Error

TOTAL*

Yes Yes YesYes

$30,716.25 $30,011.95 $176,186.39 $130,246.65

No

$0.00$169,831.40
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